Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 December, 2021 12:04 PM

To: VAUG Claims; assignments

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Pauline Tham

Subject: SNM21D207552/C02/YN6584Y/TOHHS / SBE3456Z - China TP - DOA: 23/12/2021 -
Yr Veh: YN6584Y - Estimate Cost of Repair

Attachments: file20211228114619.7816020.pdf; REPORT OF SBE3456Z.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Raymond
We refer to the above matter.

While waiting for approval on Direct Settlement, we shall appoint Ms LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your
client’s vehicle.

Aside to M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd., please assist to arrange survey on SBE3456Z.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cnhtaiping.com

alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sqg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X it TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please
delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 December 2021 11:47 am

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: SNM21D207552/C02/YN6584Y/TOHHS / FW: SBE3456Z - China TP - DOA: 23/12/2021 - Yr Veh: YN6584Y -
Estimate Cost of Repair

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good morning,
Please check the attachment
Thanks!

Best Regards
Raymond Teo



Sin Ming AutoCity

160 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575722

Showroom/Office: #03-03
Workshops: #08-08/09/10

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines)

Fax: 64599795

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg

Follow us on :

** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! **
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! **



