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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 January 2022 5:40 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: JSD 4117 DOA : 11/12/21

Hi Shiau Chan, 

 

Case finalised 

 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Motor Pte Ltd Kim Kock [mailto:kimkockmotor@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 10 January, 2022 5:36 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: JSD 4117 DOA : 11/12/21 

 

Hi Rasul , 
 

My Boss agreed for your Principal a cost of repair of LS $2,050 @ 4 days of lump sum 
repair .  
Kindly assist us for hand over your quotation report to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd 

as soon as possible. 

My Boss after few days will direct give a call to Tokio Marine Singapore for Finalize this third 

party claim. 
 

Thank You 

 

Regards, 
 

Mr Gan / Ms How 

Kim Kock Motor Pte Ltd 

Tel :  6265 0226 / 6265 0358 

Fax : 6265 2588 

 

 

 

On Mon, Jan 10, 2022 at 5:21 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi David, 
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Refer to attachment 

  

As spoken, we will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $2,050 /- with 4 days of lump 
sum repair, subject to their approval 

  

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  


