Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 17 January 2022 10:25 AM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalisation of SMU 4145A

Dear All,

Without Prejudice
Thank You for your prompt reply.
We are pleased to confirm our acceptance to your proposed COR @ $2,500.00 & 05 Repair Days.

Kindly advise OIC and reference number (if any) for our submission of LOD.(Ignore if already mentioned in the reply.)
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

John Ko

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
HP : 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Sun, Jan 16, 2022 at 7:56 AM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi John,

Without Prejudice
Attached is the adjusted estimate of SMU 4145A

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $2,500/- with 5 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




