
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
59 Loyang Drive Singapore 508969

www.cdge.com.sg

Company Registration No: 199506048W

Yours sincerely

Kazali H S

CDGE Claims Department

DID: 62148736 FAX: 62141843 Email: kazali@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer-generated letter. No signature is required.

A copy each of the following supporting documents marked [X] is enclosed:

[X] Original Repair Bill [X] Letter of Authority from Owner/Hirer/Operator

[X] GIA/Police Report(s) [X] Rental Rate Letter

[ ] LTA/GIA Search Slip(s) [X] Downtime/Mileage Record

[ ] Survey Report / Bill [ ] Witness Statement / Accident Scene Photo(s)

[ ] Driver's IC/DL/VL / Road Tax / Log Card / Certificate of Insurance

[ ] Tow Chit / PIR / Hirer's IRAS / Others :

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our clients' claims as soon

as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any

personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 24.12.2021 INVOLVING SHA1542X & GBB6418E ALONG CTE TWDS ANG MO KIO

BEFORE JLN BAHAGIA

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd , the owner of vehicle

No SHA1542X, which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle No

GBB6418E.

The vehicle owner and the taxi hirer/driver concerned have requested and authorised us to assist

them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising

from the damage of the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driver, we are submitting these

claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants:

Attn : Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD

300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07

Singapore 199555

Our Ref: CT1221/SHA1542X/KS(st)

Date: 25.01.2022

Taxi Owner's Claim :

1. Cost of Repairs

2. Loss of Rental 6 days x S$ 125.19

3. Survey Report Fee

4. LTA Search Fee

5. GIA / Police Report Fee

6. Others

Hirer's Claim :

1. Loss of Income 6 days x S$ 80.00

2. Others

[E&OE] Total Claims

S$ 7,007.22

S$ 751.14

S$ 0.00

S$ 0.00

S$ 2.00

S$ 0.00

S$ 480.00

S$ 0.00

----------------------------

S$ 8,240.36



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING Hyundai Ioniq SHA1542X  ,  GBB6418E  ON 24-Dec-21 14:10

ALONG CTE TWDS ANG MO KIO BEFORE JLN BAHAGIA

I / We LEE FOOK NAM   (Hirer) NRIC No.: SXXXX897A

and/or   (Relief) NRIC No.: SXXXX897A

Taxi Number SHA1542X

hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of earning 

   (Pending successful recovery),  loss of rental,medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim

     against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf.

4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque 

    shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of

    "ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 27-Dec-2021

Name of Hirer LEE FOOK NAM

Hirer NRIC SXXXX897A Signature :

Address 987B BUANGKOK GREEN #15-31

532987

Contact No. 84483566

Page 1 of 1CDG.VARS.V.LettofAuthorisation

27/12/2021http://cdgek2srv1:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG.VARS.V.Lettof...













Our Ref: CT21120406

Date: 20 January 2022

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 24/12/2021 @ 16:10 hrs
ALONG CTE TWDS ANG MO KIO BEFORE JLN BAHAGIA
INVOLVING GBB6418E

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717           Mainline +65 6555 1188           Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 2:45 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E *** 

LKK REF: CC4/LPC21013152/T1ga3

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 12:30 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E *** LKK REF: 
CC4/LPC21013152/T1ga3 
 
Your ref: 21/21/22/VC05/025289 
Our ref : CC4/LPC21013152/Tga3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB6418E(LONPAC) AND SHA1542X(TP) ON 24/12/2021 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 03/01/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
 
It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’ s favour. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $7,885.17(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 11,097.68 $ 7,007.22 ($6,548.80 + 7%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $125.19) $      751.14 $     625.95 (5days x $125.19) 
3. Loss of income (6days x $80.00) $      480.00 $     250.00 (5days x $50.00) 
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $         2.00 

Total $ 12,330.82 $ 7,885.17 
   
Surveyor recommended 3days for repair + 1Sunday + 1PRS = 5days. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 26/08/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 7:57 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21013152/T1ga3  
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
Our Ref: 21/21/22/VC05/025289 
  
Dear Cecilia, 
  
Any outstanding issues as the third party is chasing for settlement ? 
  
  
  
  
Best Regards 
  
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 3 January 2022 11:29 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21013152/T1ga3 
  
Dear Gerald, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
-              TP estimated cost of repair 
-              Preliminary advice 
-              Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition 
  
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilia. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  
  

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 29 December, 2021 10:52 AM 
To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E  
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
Our Ref : 21/21/22/VC05/025289 
  
Dear Summer, 
  
Attached copy of insured ‘s report for onward transmission to the case handler. 
  
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 27 December 2021 1:55 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'Loke Wei Yieng' <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>; admin-
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a@lkkauto.com 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E  
  
  
  
Dear Sir / Mdm, 
  
Thank you for your assignment. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Summer Lee | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 
1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 27 December, 2021 1:54 PM 
To: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E  
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Our Ref        : TBA 
  
Dear Loke, 
  
Our insured has not lodged the accident report and we are making enquiries. 
  
Please advise location  of accident. 
  
In the meantime, we shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for the survey. 
  
  
  
Aside to LKK – Attn : Summer 
  
                                FYA 
  
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>  
Sent: Monday, 27 December 2021 1:42 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: DOA 24.12.2021 SHA1542X with your insured GBB6418E  
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Hi officer in-charge,  

  

Herewith repair estimate of our veh damage.  

  

Save as to costs,  

  

Kindly arrange to pre-inspection vehicle at 59 Loyang Drive (S)508969 4th floor ASAP, SAS report will be 

provided once it ready.  

  

Best regards,  

  
Ms. Loke YY  
Loyang Accident Repair 
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd 
DID: 62148355  
  

 

From: canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg <canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 27 December 2021 1:19 pm 
To: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com> 
Subject: Scan Image  
  
. 
  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  
 
ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 
to print this only if necessary.  
 
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

  


