Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 12:24

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SGC 812A

Dear Sir,

Our client car is Mercedes, he rent Toyota Camry . Market Mercedes similar rental fee $200/- so he rent Toyota Camry
Rental cost alrd $150-$180/- at market . If ur insurance give loss of use $100 | accept but now is rental cost alrd out of

$100/-/
Get Outlook for iOS

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 12:21:29 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: SGC 812A

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Chris,

We refer to the email below.

Our principal offer on the rental is based on the cc not the make and model.
Therefore kindly advice your client to reconsider and let us have the acceptance.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 12:16

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SGC 812A

Dear Sir,



Please la, this wan is Mercedes le . u think | rental got $100 per day . ur ask ur insurance rent for us . Please adjust
$6700/- is my lower . Thanks

Get Outlook for i0OS

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 12:14:23 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: SGC 812A

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Chris,

We refer to the email below.

Our principal maintain the offer of $6,507.45.

Based on your client vehicle is less than 1.8cc therefore our principal offer to your client’s claim is fair and reasonable.
Please advise your client to reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 12:02

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SGC 812A

Dear Sir/ Mdm ,

Rejected your offer & request all in $6757/- Please let us have your DV soon . Thanks
Get Outlook for iOS

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 11:58:58 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: SGC 812A

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’




SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

Our principal propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair S 6,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $100) S 500.00
3. LTA Search Fee S 7.45

Total: $6,507.45

Kindly let us have your acceptance.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 April 2022 13:13

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: SGC 812A

Hi,
Enclosed as per your request.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



