
1

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 6:01 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: (Gentle Reminder) SLG7507E Estimate

  

From: Ai Nee (Motorway) Tew <ainee@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 6:00:56 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) SLG7507E Estimate 

Dear Rasul,  

 

confirm the COR. 

 

 

Thanks & Regards  

6571 9642 

Ainee 

 

 

On Thu, Nov 17, 2022 at 10:42 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Soon, 

 

Kindly acknowledge 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 11:26 am 

To: Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) SLG7507E Estimate  

  

Hi Soon, 

 

Kindly acknowledge 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 9:12 am 

To: Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) SLG7507E Estimate  

  

Hi Soon,  
  

Refer to attachment, Kindy take note audit checked part prices slightly high, necessary 

adjustment has to be made. 
 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $2,600.00 /- with 04 days of 

repair, subject to their approval. 
 

Kindly knowledge 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 14 October 2022 5:40 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) SLG7507E Estimate  

  

PROPERTY CLAIM 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY 

CLAIMS 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

Here is a gentle reminder that we are awaiting your recommended cost of repair and days of repair. 

Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

Loo Soon Hoo 
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Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd 

 

On Mon, Sep 19, 2022 at 2:41 PM Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg> wrote: 

PROPERTY CLAIM 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY 

CLAIMS 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

As requested, attached are the pictures for SLG7507E. We shall await your recommended cost of repair and days 

of repair. 

Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

Loo Soon Hoo 

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd 


