Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 January 2022 2:06 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: YP 9945) DOA : 23/11/21

From: V-TECH AUTO SERVICE <vtech.autoservice@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 January 2022 2:04:54 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: YP 9945] DOA : 23/11/21

Dear Rasul,
Accept your finalization $1950 (COR before gst) and 3 days LOU
Thank you.

Regards,

MeeKey

V-Tech Auto Service

1 Soon Lee Street
#06-04/05 Pioneer Centre
Singapore 627605

Tel: +65 6264 6222 Fax: +65 6264 6233
This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it

and notify us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any
other person.

On Thu, 6 Jan 2022 at 09:30, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Meekey,

As spoken, we will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1,950 /- with 3 days of lump sum
repair, subject to their approval

Best Regards,



Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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