Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 February 2022 4:34 PM

To: Chua Kee Sin; SUR

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SNB 829A-DOA: 14/12/2021 (CHINA TAIPING OD)
Attachments: SUPPLEMENTARY.PDF

Dear Mr Chua,

Above has been approved.

Repair limit $55,000 or whichever lower.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 24 December 2021 10:53 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SNB 829A-DOA: 14/12/2021 (CHINA TAIPING OD)

Dear Veron,
Noted.

Thank you
Best regards

Chua Kee Sin
Senior Customer Service Advisor
Body and Paint

BMW

Performance Motors Ltd

Performance Munich Autos

TEL: +65 1800 2255 269

DDI: +65 6319 0110

FAX: +65 6479 4601

Mobile: +65 9116 5200

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941
Email: chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg

www.bmw.com.sg




Sime Darby Motors
A member of the Sime Darby Group

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 December 2021 10:07 am

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: SNB 829A-DOA: 14/12/2021 (CHINA TAIPING OD)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organisation. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. Click “"Report Phishing” if you think it is malicious.

Dear Mr Chua,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SNB 829A, based on surveyor’s
marking, (Excess $1250/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



