Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 11:21 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SKV3147U Final Picture

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunautol@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 11:20:43 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKV3147U Final Picture

Dear Taufikh, thanks, please proceed to close.
Thank you and best regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23,

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
T: 63340858 | E: xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Jun 14, 2022 at 10:28 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Yi Xin,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $4150, 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Xin Yun Auto Main [mailto:xinyunautol@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 2:36 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SKV3147U Final Picture




Hi Taukikh, Please help for SKV3147U, legal side is asking this case for the final repair bill as it was last year repair,
can you please help me and give it to me asap, thanks.

Please help and thank you.

Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23,

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
T: 63340858 | E: xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, May 24, 2022 at 5:07 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,

Good afternoon.

Please help for SKV3147U, this was last year accident case, my account is closing and pending on this, sorry to
chase you.

Please assist and thank you.

Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23,

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
T: 63340858 | E: xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Thu, Mar 10, 2022 at 12:44 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:




Hi Taufikh, good afternoon, can you please help me for SKV3147U finalise, thank you.

Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto
Tel/Fax:6634 0858
Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Fri, Feb 4, 2022 at 8:21 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Taufikh,

Good evening, can you please help me for SKV3147U finalise, thank you.

Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto
Tel/Fax:6634 0858
Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Fri, Dec 31, 2021 at 2:05 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Taufikh,

Good afternoon, please refer to the attached final pictures for SKV3147U.

| will bring to car wash and final polishing, probably either late evening today, if we can complete everything,
we release to client.



If not, tomorrow we have need to be back to release to client.

Happy new year Taufikh, thanks for everything,
Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com




