Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 February 2022 12:05 PM

To: christine.yow@wearnes.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Lonpac TP : SKL885U / YQ2103M LKK REF : CC4/LPC21012882/Rps3
Attachments: DV_SKL885U.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/mdm,
We confirm settlement at $10,714.38(all-in) as per your LOD.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKES85U & YQ2103M ON 17 Dec 2021.
Dear Officer,
We wish to inform you that the repairs to our client vehicle have been completed.

We herehy submit the claims as follows:

Details Remarks Amount {S(I))
| Cost of Repairs $10,018.88

Loss Of Rental $139.10 x 5 days $695.50
[ Others

TOTAL $10,714.38

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 February 2022 11:49 AM

To: christine.yow@wearnes.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mt_claims@lonpac.com

Subject: Fw: Lonpac TP : SKL885U / YQ2103M LKK REF : CC4/LPC21012882/Rps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, CC4/LPC21012882/Rps3

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Christine Yow <christine.yow@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 10:21 AM

To: 'mt_claims@lonpac.com' <mt_claims@Ilonpac.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Lonpac TP : SKL885U / YQ2103M

Dear OIC,
We hereby attach our LOD with supporting documents for your perusal.

Kindly revert with an offer soonest. Thank you.



Best Regards,
Christine Yow
Administrator
Body & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
_w_ 28 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159105
D (65) 6430 4899

WEARMNES Www.wearnesauto.com  christine.yow@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



