Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Rachel Wu

Cc: motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg; 'SUR'; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)'; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New Assignment MSFCIL: D21003461MFBP/TT/TPD-1 TP ref: SLU7666E
Attachments: FCI2-LKKInvoice-AC2201076.pdf; GIA Rpt.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf;

LKKPhoto.pdf; Resurvey Photo-1.pdf; Resurvey Photo-2.pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclose Survey Report of SLU 7666E.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 9:56 AM

To: Rachel Wu; Reports (LKKAuto); assignments; Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: New Assignment MSFCIL: D21003461 MFBP/TT/TPD-1 TP ref: SLU7666E

Dear Rachel,

Thank you for the email.

Please be informed that we are in the midst of preparing report.
Dear Reports Team,

Kindly expedite.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 9:25 AM




To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc @lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: New Assignment MSFCIL: D21003461MFBP/TT/TPD-1 TP ref: SLU7666E

Dear Shiau Chan,
Please let me have the survey report and Invoice for the above matter.
Thank you

Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862
| Fax No. : 6507 3849 [Email: rachelwu @msfirstcapital.com.sg ICompany Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of LiEEEI Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"'):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA
Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately
by return e-mail.

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 18 February 2022 5:23 pm

To: Rachel Wu <Rachel Wu @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments @lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com:;
'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)' <siewsc @lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: New Assignment MSFCIL: D21003461MFBP/TT/TPD-1 TP ref: SLU7666E

Dear Rachel,

Thank you for your email.

Dear Shiau Chan,

Kindly assist.

FYNA Our REF : CS/FCI21012837/Aqf3
Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 |1 S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu @ msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 18 February, 2022 5:15 PM

To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; assignments @lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: RE: New Assignment MSFCIL: D21003461MFBP/TT/TPD-1 TP ref: SLU7666E

Dear LKK,

Please let me have the survey report and Invoice for the above matter.
Thank you

Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 |
DID : 6507 3862

| Fax No. : 6507 3849 [Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg ICompany Regn. No. 195000106C

A Member of MS&AD Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer
to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the
addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have
received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, December 20, 2021 3:01 PM

To: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assienments @lkkauto.com; admin-
a@]J]kkauto.com

Cc: jeromesoh @visionlawllc.com; jactan @visionlawllc.com; Rachel Wu <RachelWu @ msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
Aini Binte <Aini @msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: New Assignment

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan @msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 December, 2021 2:35 PM

To: assignments @lkkauto.com

Cc: jeromesoh@visionlawllc.com; jactan @visionlawllc.com; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
Aini Binte <Aini @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; admin @tickhaimotor.com

Subject: New Assignment

Insured Vehicle No : SG3038K

TP Vehicle No : SLU7666E

Claim No : D21003461MFBP

Workshop Name  : TICK HAI MOTOR & WELDING SERVICES
Our Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Instructions : Without Prejudice

Created By : JOANNTAN
Verified By : RACHELWU
Approved By : RACHELWU

This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail.



