
SIN SHENG AUTO WORKSHOP PTE LTD
REGISTRATION NO.: 202019500G
NO. 5 TUAS AVE 3 SINGAPORE 639405 
TEL: (+65) 6416 1996   FAX: (+65) 6863 1944   EMAIL: ENQUIRY@SINSHENG.COM.SG     
 

SIN SHENG AUTO WORKSHOP PTE LTD 

14 February 2022

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 6841 2157
Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1
#02-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Our ref: SSAW/2022/L037
Singapore 408933 Your ref: CC4/LPC21012800/ra3

Attn: Jaslin Kok

VEHICLE : XE1328M ~ (DoA: 04/12/2021)

We refer to the above and append herewith our costing for your attention please.

Cost of Repairs (S$)
Loss of Use: 7 days @ S$250/day
(including 1 day PRI) 
Third Party Vehicle Insurance Search Fee (S$)

:
:

:

10,500.00
1,750.00

7.45
Total : 12,257.45

Thank you

Yours faithfully,

M/s Sin Sheng Auto Workshop P/L

BILL TO: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD







SIN SHENG AUTO WORKSHOP PTE LTD 
REGISTRATION NO.: 202019500G 
NO. 5 TUAS AVE 3 SINGAPORE 639405 
TEL: (+65) 6416 1996   FAX: (+65) 6863 1944   EMAIL: ENQUIRY@SINSHENG.COM.SG     

SIN SHENG AUTO WORKSHOP PTE LTD 

Wah & Hua Pte Ltd Final Repair Bill : INV2022/0038  
11 Kranji Crescent Date : 12/02/2022 
WH Building Vehicle No : XE1328M 
Singapore 728656 Make/Model : IVECO / TRAKKER  

Date of Accident : 04/12/2021 
Attn: Motor Claims Department 

S/N Description Unit Amount (S$) Amount (S$) 

Lump Sum Repair                 10,500.00                    10,500.00  

              
TOTAL                  10,500.00  

(LONPAC INSURANCE BHD)
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 1:14 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: FW: PRI ~ Accident invlg XE1328M and YN2104B (Lonpac) on 04/12/2021 *** LKK 

REF: CC4/LPC21012800/Rga3 // Our Ref: 20/21/22/VC00/025262

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 10:28 am 
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 
Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: PRI ~ Accident invlg XE1328M and YN2104B (Lonpac) on 04/12/2021 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/LPC21012800/Rga3 // Our Ref: 20/21/22/VC00/025262 
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/21/22/VC00/025262 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21012800/Rga3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 
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We have highlighted to your good office on 02/01/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

OI ENCORACHED INTO TP LANE WHEN TURNING RIGHT (TP VIDEO FOOTAGE WILL EMAIL TO YOU IN ANOTHER 
EMAIL). Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “SIN SHENG AUTO WORKSHOP PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  
  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 15,176.48 $ 10,500.00 
2. Loss of Use (7days x $250.00) $   1,750.00 $   1,750.00 (7days x $250.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          7.45 $          7.45 

Total $ 16,933.93 $ 12,257.45 

  

**06days recommendation for repair + 1sunday = 7days. 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

  

The above is for your approval. 
 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 5 January, 2022 3:01 PM 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 


