12/10/21, 5:25 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SFM 2121G OD GREAT AMERICA INSURANCE

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Fri 10/12/2021 5:20 PM
To: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Dear Jason,

We have check with insurance, please proceed with list price.
Final mandate to be taken approval.(subjected to insurance approval)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 December 2021 4:30 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>
Cc: Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SFM 2121G OD GREAT AMERICA INSURANCE

Without Prejudice
According to owner’s broker any workshop plan should allow list price.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#01-46/48/50, AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal
injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant.
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12/10/21, 5:25 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, December 10, 2021 4:27 PM

To: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>
Cc: Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SFM 2121G OD GREAT AMERICA INSURANCE

Dear Jason,
Propose cost plus 15% instead.

Please consider.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 December 2021 4:00 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>
Cc: Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SFM 2121G OD GREAT AMERICA INSURANCE

Without Prejudice

Dear Denise,

We do not agree to Cost plus 10%.

We understand that any workshop plan should allow list price.

We await your reply.

Thank you.
Best Regards
Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#01-46/48/50, AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal
injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant.
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12/10/21, 5:25 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, December 10, 2021 3:14 PM

To: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SFM 2121G OD GREAT AMERICA INSURANCE

Dear Kevin,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SFM 2121G (Excess $600/-).
Please put-up Cost plus 10%.

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Final mandate to be taken approval.(subjected to insurance approval)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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