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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 9:59 AM

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'Jessie Ong'; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; SUR

Subject: RE: GBJ3590S - OD FINALIZE - DOA: 06.12.2021

Dear Andrew, 
 
 
COR Lump Sum $8300 before excess $1500 with 10 repair days 
 
Will offer in merimen shortly. 
 
  

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 4 February 2022 10:10 AM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg 

Subject: RE: GBJ3590S - OD FINALIZE - DOA: 06.12.2021 

 

Hi Veron 

 

Please confirm the finalize amount. 

 

 
Best Regards, 
Andrew Goh 
Motor Claims Officer 

Tel: +65 8183 2078 
Email: andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg 

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop) 

37 Loyang Way,Singapore 508734 

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com 

 
 
 

PAN PACIFIC VAN & TRUCK LEASING PTE LTD  

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop) 

37 Loyang Way 

Singapore 508734 

www.PanPacificLeasing.com.sg  
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Disclaimer: This email is intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. It contains privileged and confidential information. If you have 

received this email by error, please notify the sender immediately and delete it from your system. 

Unauthorised use, copying or dissemination of any information in the email is prohibited. Due to the inherent nature of internet 

communication, we are not liable for damages caused by any computer virus that may be transmitted. 

 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 11:10 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ppemclaims@gmail.com 

Subject: Re: GBJ3590S - OD FINALIZE - DOA: 06.12.2021 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

I`ve checked the finalize. Kindly assist. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks, 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 11:04 pm 

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com> 

Cc: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg 

<ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg> 

Subject: GBJ3590S - OD FINALIZE - DOA: 06.12.2021  

  

Hi Andrew, 

 

Kindly request after spray photo. 
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Thanks  

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com> 

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 12:56 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg 

<ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg> 

Subject: GBJ3590S - OD FINALIZE - DOA: 06.12.2021  

  

Dear Steve 

  

We will undertake the repair of this vehicle @ COR L/S $8300.00 (before GST & excess) with 10 repair days. 

  

Kindly confirm acceptance. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Andrew Goh 
Motor Claims Officer 

Tel: +65 8183 2078 
Email: andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg 

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop) 

37 Loyang Way,Singapore 508734 

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com 

  
  
  
PAN PACIFIC VAN & TRUCK LEASING PTE LTD  
EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop) 
37 Loyang Way 

Singapore 508734 

www.PanPacificLeasing.com.sg  
  
  
  
Disclaimer: This email is intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. It contains privileged and confidential information. If you have 

received this email by error, please notify the sender immediately and delete it from your system. 
Unauthorised use, copying or dissemination of any information in the email is prohibited. Due to the inherent nature of internet 

communication, we are not liable for damages caused by any computer virus that may be transmitted. 

  

  


