Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Sin Hock Lee Motor Repair <sinhocklee@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 7 February 2022 16:36

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Sin Hock Lee

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8852E AND GBK 8513C ON 29/11/2021
Attachments: GBE8852E - TP.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Your reference: CC4/A1G21012258/Vea3

Our reference: LFM/GL/TP/gbe8852e/ms

7 February 2022

M/s LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd
c/o AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

Attn: Motor Claim Dept (Third Party)

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD ACCIDENT ON 30.11.2021 INVOLVING GBE8852E & GBK8513C

ALONG WOODLANDS DRIVE 14 BLK 515 LOADING/UNLOADING SERVICE ROAD

We refer to the matter.

We are the repairer of vehicle no. GBE8852E. We are instructed to claim damages against your insured/insured's driver,
in connection to the above-mentioned traffic accident on behalf of our client, M/s Tube Innovation, the owner of
vehicle no. GBE8852E.



We are instructed that the accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence in driving and/or management of
the vehicle, GBK8513C. As a result, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense,
particularly of which are as follows:-

1 Cost of repairs : $2,400.00
2 GST 7% : $168.00
3 Loss of Rental ($180 x 4 days) : $720.00

Total : $3,288.00

Enclose herewith the supporting documents:

a) Authorisation To Act;
b) Final repair bill; and

¢) Rental agreement cum official receipt

Please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned for any clarifications.

Thanks & regards,
May Sim

SIN HOCK LEE MOTOR REPAIR

Co. Regn. No. 24928500B

GST Regn. No. M90366191A

Blk 51, Ubi Avenue 1,

#01-09, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408933

Tel: +65 6282 6184 Fax: +65 6287 5977
Email: sinhocklee@yahoo.com.sg

The information transmitted by this email/facsimile communication, including any additional pages or attachments, is
intended only for the addressee and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any interception, review,
retransmission, disclosure, dissemination, or other use and/or taking of any action upon this information by persons or
entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited by law and may subject them to criminal or civil liability. If you
received this communication in error, please contact us immediately at +65 62826184, and delete the communication
from any computer or network system or dispose of the documents as directed. Thank you.

On Monday, 7 February 2022, 04:10:19 pm SGT, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <ashersng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21012258/Vea3



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

We, TUBE INNOVATION , UEN No. 53312453X (“the third party claimant™) of 13
Old Airport Road #01-55 Singapore 390013, owner of GBE8852E hereby authorize
M/s SIN HOCK LEE MOTOR REPAIR (“the workshop™) to act for us with respect to
our claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for our vehicle no.
GBES852E that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 30/11/2021 @
2000hrs along Woodlands Drive 14, Blk 515 loading/unloading service road involving
vehicle no. GBK8513C (“the accident™).

We further authorize the workshop to settle our above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of our claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of M/s SIN HOCK
LEE MOTOR REPAIR.

We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on our behalf is on
a without prejudice and without any admission of liability basis insofar as the

driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this 06 of December 2021

TUBE INNOVATION [
CO. REG. NO. 53312453X L}
!/

L

Sign by “the tlJird partly claimant” Sign by* e workshop”



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, SIN HOCK LEE MOTOR REPAIR (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$$2.568.00 (Repair Cost), $3320.00 (Loss of Use/Rentat), 8§ — (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
GBE 8852E that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 29/11/2021 (date) along
BLK 515 WOODLANDS DRIVE 14 SERVICE ROAD LOADING/UNLOADING (location)
involving vehicle no/s GBK 8513C. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 06/12/2021
(date) at “‘the workshop™. -

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner TUBE INNOVATION (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. GBE 8852E make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to GBE 8852E (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __26 (day) of APR (month) Zoﬁ(year)

©,.

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed b}ylthe W " (with chop)




SIN HOCK LEE MOTOR REPAIR

UEN No. : 24928500B GST NO. : M90366191A

BLK 51 UBI AVENUE 1 #01-09

PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK SINGAPORE 408933

Tel No. : 6282 6184 Fax: 6287 5977

M/S TUBE INNOVATION

13 OLD AIRPORT ROAD Tax Invoice : TP2100019
#01-55 Date: 21/12/2021
SINGAPORE 390013 Vehicle Num.: GBE8852E
Make/Model : TOYOTA PROACE L1H1 1.6M
Chassis #: YARXT9HMODZ070923
Accident Date : 30/11/2021
S/N  Quantity Particular Amount'S$
1 1 Lump sum repairs: 2,400.00
Inclusive of parts, labour,
panel beating & spray painting
E.&O.E. Sub-Total S$ : 2,400.00
7 GST 7% 168.00
Total S§ : 2,568.00

for snyocrc LEE MOTOR REPAIR




Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 February 2022 16:06

To: WILLINGHEARTSINGAPORE@GMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 8513C AND GBE 8852E ON 29/11/2021

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21012258/Vea3

07 FEB 2022

WILLING HEARTS

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 8513C AND GBE 8852E ON 29/11/2021

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

Email: Ashersng@Ikkauto.com

c.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



4/13/22, 10:44 AM Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*GBE8852E (5371760382SG)
[GBK8513C]
TP
TUBE INNOVATION
Nov 29 2021 7:50PM
[WILLING HEARTS]
Sin Hock Lee Motor Repair

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 12/04/2022 17:22 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2900.00) - GBE8852E - Claim Handler: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Approved:2900.00:SUBJ TO ALL DOCS/BILLING VERIFIED IN ORDER, SAB FRM: $2900 (ALL-IN). TP LOA TO REDO. TP
RENTAL VEHICLE SHOULD NOT BE UPGRADED TO A PRIVATE CAR.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=93490352&CFTOKEN=d028926213592805-44E78... 1/1
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