Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 10:57 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: GBE3025j

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref:21/21/21/VC05/025204
Dear Shiau Chan,

Please proceed to repair as adjusted and understand that it is on lump sum basis.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 8:57 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>
Subject: RE: GBE3025j

Dear Gerald,

The advice is inclusive of check items and according to the repairer, the vehicle repairer on Lump Sum basis.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 7:25 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBE3025j

Lonpac External - Confidential

Is the advice correct ?

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 January 2022 5:18 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: Recall: GBE3025j

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) would like to recall the message, "GBE3025j".



