
1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 22 February 2022 2:54 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); TEAMWORK
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z 

//DOA:19/10/2021//LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 /GBF 8432D)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We wish to inform that we have the received the settlement cheque for the sum of $7,555.00. 
 
Thank you and have a nice day. 
 
Regards, 
 

Shu Shan 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24/34 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 6844 2475  
Fax:6844 2474 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, February 17, 2022 4:48 PM 
To: TEAMWORKGARAGE 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z //DOA:19/10/2021//LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi, 
 
We are processing payment and will get back to you by next week. 
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.  

  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: - 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: TEAMWORKGARAGE <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 16 February 2022 3:44 pm 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA:19/10/2021//LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D)  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear sir / mdm , 

  

We refer to the matter above , we would like to remind you guys that we have yet to receive any payment 

from you guys. 

  

Please let us have the payment soonest so we can settle the case amicably 

  
  
Thank you and have a nice day!  সহ঺঻ 
  
Letitia 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore (408934) 
Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Wednesday, 9 February 2022 10:47 am 
To: Darren 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA:19/10/2021//LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Darren, 
  
Kindly let us have all the original documents for our further action.  
  
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 



3

  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 February 2022 10:27 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021//LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
Please refer to attach signed DV. 
  
Kindly let us have your payment soonest. 
  
Darren 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24/#01-34 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 68442475 
Fax: 68442474 
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 10:16 AM 
To: TEAMWORK 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021//LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for your acceptance. 
  
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 January 2022 12:02 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021// LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
We refer to your offer below, it is acceptable. 
  
Please let us have your DV soonest. 
  
Thank you and have a nice day. 
  
Regards, 
 

Shu Shan 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24/34 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 6844 2475  
Fax:6844 2474 
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, January 27, 2022 11:16 AM 
To: TEAMWORK 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 
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Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021// LKKRef:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,955.00 
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100.00) $    600.00 

Total $ 7,555.00 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 21 January 2022 10:46 AM 
To: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021// LKK Ref:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 
46356 /GBF 8432D) 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi, 
  
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 20/01/2022. 
  
We will look into the matter and get back to you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 20 January 2022 12:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021// LKK Ref:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 
46356 /GBF 8432D) 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
Please find attached LOD as requested. 
  
Thank you and have a nice day. 
  
Regards, 
 

Shu Shan 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24/34 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 6844 2475  
Fax:6844 2474 
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, January 20, 2022 10:11 AM 
To: CLAIMS TEAMWORK 
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 
Subject: [Request for LOD] - Your Ref: GBD161Z // DOA: 19/10/2021// LKK Ref:CC2/MIDA21012175/r (MID 46356 
/GBF 8432D) 
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Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military 
vehicles with effect from December 2021. 
  
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to 
us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
  
  
  
  
 


