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Confidential: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is
intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply
to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise
disclose its contents to any person.

From: Waij Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, October 13, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>

Cc: Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Revised Offer | JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 | Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X) Accident involving
SHD9224X /MIDS7103 Along Choa Chu Kang Way Towards KJE

Without prejudice

Dear Sharon Py

AJ TR
Ng Wai Yin

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.comr 52
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over
the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764 -

From: Sharon Ow [mailto:sharon@jpknights.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 October, 2021 10:07 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Revised Offer | JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 | Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X) Accident involving
SHD9224X /MID97103 Along Choa Chu Kang Way Towards KJE

Without Prejudice
Dear Wai Yin

Our Principal are pleased to revise the offer as below -

Cost of repair (w/gst) S 7,550.00
Loss of Rental (4.5d x$96.30) S 433.35
Loss of income (4.5d x $40.00) S 180.00
Total S 8,163.35
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