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From: RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN <Rishabh Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, August 25, 2021 4:22 PM

To: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>

Cc: MOHAMMED TAUFIQ BIN MOHAMMED HAKQUL MUBIN
<Mohammed Taufig _Bin_Mohammed Hakqul Mubin@defence.gov.sg>; HO AlK SENG, DENNIS

<HO_Aik_Seng Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT <KANG Wee Huat Edwin@defence.gov.sg>
Subject: Documents for I0D20/21/0009 involving MID97103 and SHD9224X

Hi Sharon,
Please ignore the last two emails. There was a technical difficulty on our end.

Attached are two pdf files. One contains the 10D for 20/21/0009, another contains the driver’s statement, police
report, accident photographs, and ECOR for the same case. Let me know if you need anything else. If you have all
the necessary documents, please let me know when you will send over the invoice.

Thanks in advance.

Best Regards,
Rishabh

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error."

<<Message from Defence Mail Administrator>>: Please be informed that the direct URL linking and clicking has
been disabled. Copy and paste the URL to the browser to access the website. Thank you.

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error."

<<Message from Defence Mail Administrator>>: Please be informed that the direct URL linking and clicking has
been disabled. Copy and paste the URL to the browser to access the website. Thank you.
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From: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, September 29, 2021 3:37 PM

To: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>; HO AIK SENG, DENNIS <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>

Cc: MOHAMMED TAUFIQ BIN MOHAMMED HAKQUL MUBIN
<Mohammed_Taufig_Bin_Mohammed_Hakqul_Mubin@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN
<Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>; Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Candy Cai <candycai@jpknights.com>
Subject: Re: Request Mandate : DSTA21-070014 Your ref : IODCY20/21/0009 Accident Involving SHD9224X and
MID97103 Along Junction of Choa Chu Kang Way on 13/07/2021

Please proceed thanks.

From: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 September 2021 10:15:30 AM

To: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS; EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT

Cc: MOHAMMED TAUFIQ BIN MOHAMMED HAKQUL MUBIN; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN; Survey; Candy Cai
Subject: Request Mandate : DSTA21-070014 Your ref : IODCY20/21/0009 Accident Involving SHD9224X and
MID97103 Along Junction of Choa Chu Kang Way on 13/07/2021

Your Ref: CY/20/21/0009
Qur Ref: DSTA21-070014

Dear Maj Edwin

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID397103 AND SHD9224X ALONG JUNCTION OF CHOA CHU KANG WAY ON 13 JULY 2021

We refer to the above matter.

This is a case of where our MINDEF vehicle had steered to right into the path of the civilian vehicle while making
right turn, resulted grazed and hit onto the civilian vehicle which was traveling on the right of MID97103.

We are of the view that the liability is against our MINDEF driver.
Hence. we would like to seek you approval to negotiate and reach settlement with TP repair.

Summary to offer to TP repairer "Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd" is as follows:

Claimed amount Seek Mandate
Cost of repair $7,550.10 $7,550.10
Loss of rental S481.50 $288.90
$96.30 x 5 days $96.30 x 3 days
Loss of income $250.00 $120.00
$50.00 x 5days $40.00 x 3days
Total $8,281.60 $7,859.00




11/16/21, 3:51 PM Mail - Sharon Ow - Outlook

Claims Department

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink ?popoutv2=1&version=20211101003.14 12/12



11/16/21, 3:51 PM Mail - Sharon Ow - Outlook

Claims Department

From: Anthony Lim [mailto:anthony@jpknights.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 21, 2021 10:52 AM

To: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Survey <survey@jpknights.com>
Subject: RE: AAD2107-050 FINALISE --SHD9224X

Hi,

The recommended cost of repair is P/P $7,056.17 and 3 working days.

The above mentioned amount is subjected to Mindef approval and negotiation.

Kindly submit your final bill and necessary documents to us further handling.

Best Regards,
Anthony Lim

F Y
JP KNIGHTS PTE LTD | 33 UBI AVE 3 #05-47 VERTEX TOWER A SINGAPORE 408868 |CO REG: 2007237637
Tel: (65) 6345 0068 | Fax: (65) 6344 5328 |
www.jpknights.com; www.aspectus.sg
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Confidential: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for
the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
il

From: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 July 2021 5:17 pm

To: Anthony Lim <anthony@jpknights.com>

Cc: 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Survey <survey@jpknights.com>
Subject: AAD2107-050 FINALISE --SHD9224X

Dear Anthony
Able to finalize for this case?

Kindly please check and confirm the amount if agreeable. Thank you

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink ?popoutv2=1&version=20211101003.14 10/12



11/16/21, 3:51 PM Mail - Sharon Ow - Outlook

From: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, July 21, 2021 11:28 AM

To: Anthony Lim <anthony@jpknights.com>

Cc: 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims
<claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: AAD2107-050 FINALISE --SHD9224X

Dear Anthony

Amount confirm: $ 7,056.17 (before GST)

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?popoutv2=18&version=20211101 003.14 8/12



11/16/21, 3:51 PM Mail - Sharon Ow - Qutlook
Ng Wai Yin
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over
the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Sharon Ow [mailto:sharon@jpknights.com]

Sent: Sunday, 12 September, 2021 4:39 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Survey <survey@jpknights.com>: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Request Video -JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X) Accidnet involving -
SHD9224X /MID97103 Along Choa Chu Kang Way Towards KJE

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai Yin

Plcasc provide video footage for claim review.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Sharon Ow

JP KNIGHTS PTE LTD | 33 UBI AVE 3 #05-46/47 VERTEX TOWER A SINGAPORE 408868 |CO REG: 2007237632
Tel: 6345 0068 |Fax: 6344 5328 |FLASH Accident Reporting Hotline: 6100 1620 / 6360 1038; Web: www.jpknights.com
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Confidential: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is
intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply
to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise
disclose its contents to any person.

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, September 2, 2021 3:32 PM

To: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>

Cc: Anthony Lim <anthony@jpknights.com>; Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims
<claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Request LOD -JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X)

Without prejudice

Dear Sharon

Attached is LOD for your action

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink ?popoutv2=1&version=20211101003. 14 6/12



11/16/21, 3:51 PM Mail - Sharon Ow - Outlook

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai Yin

The loss of rental and loss of income is based on the surveyor recommendation.
Please reconsider.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Sharon Ow

JP KNIGHTS PTE LTD | 33 UBI AVE 3 #05-46/47 VERTEX TOWER A SINGAPORE 408868 |CO REG: 200723763Z
Tel: 6345 0068 |Fax: 6344 5328 |FLASH Accident Reporting Hotline: 6100 1620 / 6360 1038; Web: www:.jpknights.com
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Confidential: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is
intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply
to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise
disclose its contents to any person.

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, October 1, 2021 1:21 PM

To: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>

Cc: Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Offer | JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 | Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X) Accident involving
SHD9224X /MID97103 Along Choa Chu Kang Way Towards KJE

Without prejudice

Dear Sharon
For a quick amicable settlement, we are prepared to settle our claims as follow :-

Cost of Repair :$7,550.10
Loss of Rental :$433.35 ($96.3 x 4.5 days —taxi grounded into workshop after accident, survey on 15/7(Thu))
Loss of income : $180.00 (540 x 4.5 days)

Total $8,163.45

Please proceed to send us the DV,

Yo |

Ng Wai Yin

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.se
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over
the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink ?popoutv2=1&version=20211101003.14 412
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Confidential: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is
intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply
to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise
disclose its contents to any person.

From: Waij Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, October 13, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Sharon Ow <sharon@jpknights.com>

Cc: Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Revised Offer | JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 | Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X) Accident involving
SHD9224X /MIDS7103 Along Choa Chu Kang Way Towards KJE

Without prejudice

Dear Sharon Py

AJ TR
Ng Wai Yin

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.comr 52
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over
the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764 -

From: Sharon Ow [mailto:sharon@jpknights.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 October, 2021 10:07 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Survey <survey@jpknights.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Revised Offer | JPK Ref : DSTA21-070014 | Your ref : AAD2107-050 (SHD9224X) Accident involving
SHD9224X /MID97103 Along Choa Chu Kang Way Towards KJE

Without Prejudice
Dear Wai Yin

Our Principal are pleased to revise the offer as below -

Cost of repair (w/gst) S 7,550.00
Loss of Rental (4.5d x$96.30) S 433.35
Loss of income (4.5d x $40.00) S 180.00
Total S 8,163.35

https://outlook. office.com/mail/deeplink ?popoutv2=18&version=20211101003.14 2112



