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23 December 2021

Our Reference :GBE1922H
Your Reference : SLV7066G

Attn: Motor Claims Department

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET #04-02

10B BUILDING

Singapore 049711

Dear Sir/Madam,

Subject: Accident Involving GBE1922H and SLV7066G on 24/11/2021 at Junction with Wallich
Street

We refer to the above case.
We are instructed by our client to file claim for the damages against your insured.

Our client has suffered loss and damage as a result of your Insured’s negligence in the driving of
vehicle No. SLV7066G.

We quantify our client’s claim as follows:
1. Cost of Repair (510,700 x 7% GST) S$  11,449.00

2. Loss of Use (6 days) SS 1080.00
3. Third Party Search fee SS 7.45
Total 3 12,536.50

We hereby append the following relevant documents for your perusal:

l. Repair Bill Tax Invoice

Il. Surveyor Finalised COR Email
Il Third Party Search Fee

V. Letter of Authority

Please let us know within the next 14 days from the receipt of this letter, whether you are prepared
to accept all the above amount.

LIEW S %
Assistant, Motor Claims Admin
GOLDBELL Engineering Pte Ltd
Tel : 97397127

Email : LiewSiMing@Goldbell.com.sg
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TAX INVOICE
INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD GST Reg No. © M9-0002514-E
oo Bl Invoice No. :  EXI00306831
SINGAPORE 049711 Invoice Date. ¢ 23-12-2021
Attn: MRS LEONG Account No. © C00001902
Quotation No. © 146439
Work Order No. : 1198516
Service Centre. : 8 TUAS AVE 18
Agreement No. : GBE~63137
Reg No : GBE1922H
Chassis No : JTFAT35YX0K205011
Engine No : 1KD2555875
Model No : DYNA 150 MANUAL
Mileage : 0
SRR No :
ACCIDENT REPAIR: GBE/SVC/SALES-HQ/24-2411
DATE OF ACCIDENT: 24/11/2021
POLICY NO: DMCVSNW00096832103
*** TP CLAIM - INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE ***
Description QTY Disc Net Price Ext Price
LUMP SUM REPAIR 1 N 10700.00 10700.00
Parts Charges: 10700.00
Sub Total: 10700.00
GST@ 7.00% 749.00
E.&0.E
TOTAL ___ 11449.00

Please make all cheques payable to GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD.
When making payment, please quote our invoice numbers.
No receipts will be issued for Cheque Payments.

Terms and conditions of sales
Interest at 1.5% per month will be charged on overdue account

This is a computer generated document. No signature is required.
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Liew Si Ming N

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 22, 2021 10:16 PM

To: Liew Si Ming

Cc: Ramesh; Hasrianah Binte Hassan; Catherine Chong Kai Ling; Admin A; Cecilia Chong
{LKK Auto)

Subject: GBE1922H and SLV7066G (GRAB) TP Claims, Date of Accident 24 Nov 2021 at/along
Junction with Wallich Street

Attachments: GBE1922M workshop FINALISE.pdf; GBE 1922 finalize pdf

Hi S1 Ming,

We confirm the finalize $10,700.00 (L/S, before GST). 6 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen] Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Liew $i Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 December 2021 4:31 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Hasrianah Binte Hassan <Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai
Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: GBE1922H and SLV7066G (GRAB) TP Claims, Date of Accident 24 Nov 2021 at/along Junction with Wallich Street

Hi Steve,

Please kindly help to finalise GBE1922H.
Thank You.



You've sent a payment of $7.45 SGD to
Land Transport Authority
(LTA VRL CCRSPM@Ita.gov.sg)

It may take a few moments for this transaction to appear in your account.

Transaction ID Transaction date
1CF64431D53226005 Oct 23, 2021 12:14:07 SST

Seller Instructions to seller

Land Transport Authority You haven't entered any instructions.

LTA VRL CCRSPM@Ita.gov.sg

Invoice ID
20211023121255800161

Save on the brands you love

Shop securely at millions of online stores around the world

Shop Now

Description Unit price Qty Amount
LTA eServices $7.45SGD | $7.45 SGD
Subtotal $7.45 SGD

Total $7.45 SGD
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Appendix A

LETTER OF AUTHORITY

I/We, PENGUIN SHIPYARD INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD , owner of GBE1922H  (Vehicle no.) hereby
authorize GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD to act on my/our behalf with respect to my/our claim for
repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my vehicle no. GBE1922H that was damage pursuant to
the accident which occurred on 24/11/2021  at/along JUNCTION WITH WALLICH STREET _ involving
vehicle no. SLV7066G .

I/We permit GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD to have full discretion to settle my/our above-mentioned
claim in a manner that they deem fit and to sign any discharge voucher or receive any payment on my/our
behalf further to the settlement of my/our claim with payment cheque/s being made in favor of GOLDBELL
ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

I/We authorize GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD to have full discretion in the usage of my/our (owner
and or driver) NRIC, work permit, driving license and whatsoever identification card, indemnity against
PDPA terms and conditions.

I/We acknowledge that any settlement that GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD may reach on my/our
behalf is in full and final settlement of my/our property damage claims against the owner/ driver/ motor
insurer of the third party vehicle bearing registration number SLV7066G _and is on a without prejudice /
without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/ owner/ motor insurer of vehicle concerned.

Date this 09 day of _ pPecembe (month) 202 (year)

Claimant Vehicle Driver

(Vehicle owner or Company representative)
J

Signature Signature

2l N Jeed
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Full name as per Identiy card

Full name as per Identiy card

Company Stamp if applicable

AIRMAN.

Company Stamp if applicable
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