Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Veron,

Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 9 December 2021 6:49 PM
Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

RE: SGH 7239H DOCS

SGH 7239 EST1.pdf

Attached revised estimate, COR L/S$1100, 4 DAYS, photos in Merimen.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 30 November 2021 12:15 AM

To: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'
Subject: SGH 7239H DOCS

Hi Veron,

Attached docs for this OD case. Photos uploaded in Merimen.

Regards
Taufikh



