Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 6:44 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBS 8821X FINALISE
Attachments: FBS 8821X.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,

Can submit this case, workshop agree as attached COR $2601, 4 days.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 21 February 2022 1:01 PM

To: 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)'

Subject: FW: FBS 8821X FINALISE

Hi Shiau Chan,
Can update if case already audit, want to finalise with workshop, thank you.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 11 February 2022 6:29 PM

To: 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)'

Subject: FBS 8821X FINALISE

Hi Shiau Chan,
Can audit 1st, photos in Views.

Regards
Taufikh



