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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 February 2022 4:06 PM

To: Liew Si Ming; Catherine Chong Kai Ling

Cc: Ramesh; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YQ2231B and YP7396G OD Claims, Date of Accident 18/11/2021 BEFORE 

JURONG TOWN HALL ROAD EXIT

Dear Catherine, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

As spoken with you. 

 

Confirm final fig $42,207.34 before excess $1,000.00 & GST and 20 repair days. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 25 February 2022 8:50 AM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Steve 

Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YQ2231B and YP7396G OD Claims, Date of Accident 18/11/2021 BEFORE JURONG TOWN HALL ROAD 

EXIT 

 

Hi Shiau Chan, 

 

 

Just to follow up, any updates on the finalise amount? 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:  | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, February 21, 2022 1:15 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si 

Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: YQ2231B and YP7396G OD Claims, Date of Accident 18/11/2021 BEFORE JURONG TOWN HALL ROAD EXIT 

 

Hi Shiau Chan, 

 

I`ve checked the finalize. Kindly assist. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 14 February 2022 9:29 am 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Jaslin Kok 

(LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: YQ2231B and YP7396G OD Claims, Date of Accident 18/11/2021 BEFORE JURONG TOWN HALL ROAD EXIT  

  

Hi Steve, 

  

  

Please kindly help to finalise YQ2231B. 

Thank You. 

  

  

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:  | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 
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