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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 10 December 2021 11:39 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR; Andre Chow En De; SUR
Subject: LOD-TP - LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21011914/ea3, C&C Ref: SLW1792C, claim TP AGI 

SMH3166P, DOA: 21/11/2021
Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Attached our repair invoice, rental bill & agreement, and Authorisation to Act, for your perusal. 
 
Do let us know if you need the original copies to be mail to you. 
 
Our client’s claim is as stated below: 
 
COR       $ 2,517.50 
LOR       $     385.20 ($128.40/day x 3 days) 
                --------------- 
Total      $ 2,902.70 
                ---------------- 
 
Kindly offer for settlement. 
 
Appreciate. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Loi Ai Ting 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4556  •  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  












