12/19/21, 11:03 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: YP5022Z Estimate

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Thu 16/12/2021 4:16 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your proposed lump sum repair of $8,500.00 at
9 working days for YP 5022 Z .

Thank you.
Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:31 PM

To: 'Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd' <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP5022Z Estimate

Hi,
As per our tele-conversation, revised COR 1/s$8500, 9 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 10 December 2021 11:36 AM

To: 'Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd'

Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: YP5022Z Estimate

Hi,
Revised final COR I/s $8400, 9 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto
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From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 9 December 2021 10:52 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); 'Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd'
Subject: Re: YP5022Z Estimate

Dear Sir/madam,
Can confirm finalise?

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 December 2021 4:28 pm

To: 'Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd' <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP50227 Estimate

Hi,
COR lumpsum $8050, 9 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 6 December 2021 1:16 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: YP5022Z Estimate

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Attached is an image of your marked estimate for YP 5022 Z.

We look forward to your proposed lump sum repair cost and your recommended days of
repair.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soon.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
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