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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 6 January 2022 7:21 pm
To: Admin A; CS A Team
Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Tan Wei Teck (Strides 

Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Strides Automotive Services Pte 
Ltd); Balqish Binte Abdul Halil (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Foo Chit Yan 
(Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/10/21/5036(AIG) - ACCIDENT ON 23/10/21 INVOLVING SMB1649H AND 
SMK4903G ALONG BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 7-BS:43649 (HOME TEAMNS)

Attachments: BUS 10 21 5036 INV.pdf; BUS 10 21 5036 LTA.pdf; BUS 10 21 5036 SAS.pdf

Dear Sirs,  
  
We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB1649H. Your client's 
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,  
 

Cost of Repair $1,800.00            

Loss of Use $825.00  ( 3 days x $275.00  ) 

LTA search fee $7.00            

Total $2,632.00            
 
We enclose the following documents,                                                                                                                                  

1)   1) Repair Invoice 
2)   2) GIA report 

3) LTA Search Fee 
  
We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment 
by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.  
 
Thanks & Regards 
Hua Yen 
 











1

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 10:09 am
To: 'lee_lay_tin@yahoo.com'
Subject: <STANDARD LETTER>ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 4903G & SMB 1649H ON 

23/10/2021

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC3/AIG21011750/Rga3                                          
                                                                                                 
27 JULY 2022 
 
LEE LAY TIN 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 4903G & SMB 1649H ON 23/10/2021                      

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor 
Insurer (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under 
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SMB 1649H. 
             
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 3 days from the date of this letter together with the supporting evidence (E:g: Video Footage / Traffic 
Police Investigation result). 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD 
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> SMRT BUSES LTD. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(205176) MAN NL320F (A22) 10.5 D ABS TURBO (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Clm Created
Reg No: SMB1649H. Acct Date: 2021/10/23. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. L
td. (SG). TP Insurer: MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Strides Automotive Services Pte
Ltd (Woodlands)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/11/26 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (E
xpress)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
17 Nov
2021
22:31

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
17 Nov
2021
22:40

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
17 Nov
2021
22:40

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
26 Jul
2022
10:46

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Yong,

Joanne

12
27 Jul
2022
09:27

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Tan,

Bennie-WZ

13
27 Jul
2022
10:14

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] Chong

Pui Lin

14
10 Oct
2022
13:08

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
10 Oct
2022
13:08

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
10 Oct
2022
13:08

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2015/02/27.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
10 Oct
2022
13:08

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
11 Oct
2022
17:35

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

19
11 Oct
2022
17:37

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2632.00:Liability: 100%(OID hit TP right side while OID tried to overtook TP)
*Quantum: $2,6
32.00 (all-in). Pls refer to adjuster report for details.
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

20
12 Oct
2022
17:11

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/11/26. Mandate Remarks: Please attempt to settle LOU @ $250/da
y as they previously also agree with the rate.

[I] Lee,
Ming-Yao

21
12 Oct
2022
17:11

Adj
Mandate Set

Approved:2632.00:Please attempt to settle LOU @ $250/day as they previously also agree with the rat
e.

[I] Lee,
Ming-Yao

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
No record



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2741935 18 Nov 2021
12:27:44 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SMB1649H Low, Xianyu xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=98928369&CFTOKEN=f542a017163c610e-4D0D2B67-930D-EEA1-666E5845A92ECA4E&USID=3251&RID=1793750
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=98928369&CFTOKEN=f542a017163c610e-4D0D2B67-930D-EEA1-666E5845A92ECA4E&USID=3251&RID=1793750
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=98928369&CFTOKEN=f542a017163c610e-4D0D2B67-930D-EEA1-666E5845A92ECA4E&USID=3251&RID=1793750
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=98928369&CFTOKEN=f542a017163c610e-4D0D2B67-930D-EEA1-666E5845A92ECA4E&USID=3251&RID=1793750&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1046526%26extid%3D373820%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=98928369&CFTOKEN=f542a017163c610e-4D0D2B67-930D-EEA1-666E5845A92ECA4E&USID=3251&RID=1793750
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2741936 18 Nov 2021
12:34:31

TP Case
(Insurer)

Motor LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SMB1649H SMK4903G 11.00

2853693 10 Oct 2022
13:08:36

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SMB1649H SMK4903G 11.00







