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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 February 2022 9:25 AM

To: Zhe Hao Lau; lcrarc (lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg); Steve Chen (LKK Auto); siaktong 

(siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg)

Subject: FW: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE-SLG 2890E

Attachments: SLG 2890E FINAL MARKING.pdf

Dear Jason/Mr Sim 

 

 

Please updates. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 17 January 2022 9:21 AM 

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; 

lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE-SLG 2890E 

 

Dear Jason/Mr Sim 

 

 

Any updates. 

                                                                                         

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 13 January 2022 11:20 AM 

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; 

lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE-SLG 2890E 

 

Dear Jason, 



2

 

 

Any updates. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 January 2022 4:06 PM 

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; 

lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE-SLG 2890E 

 

Dear Jason/Mr Sim, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of  LS $2250 with 3 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 10 January 2022 4:44 PM 

To: 'Siak Tong Sim' <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; 'jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg' 

<jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; 'lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg' <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE 

 

Dear Mr Sim/Jason, 

 

As Jason spoken. 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  
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1) SLL 3050E-DOA: 2/11/21 

2) SLG 2890E-DOA: 6/11/21 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 5 January 2022 4:19 PM 

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; 

lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE 

 

Dear Mr Sim/Jason, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 

1) SLL 3050E-DOA: 2/11/21 

2) SLG 2890E-DOA: 6/11/21 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 21 December 2021 1:50 PM 

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; 

lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE 

 

Dear Mr Sim/Jason, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  
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1) SLL 3050E-DOA: 2/11/21 

2) SLG 2890E-DOA: 6/11/21 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 6 December 2021 4:28 PM 

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; 

lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: VEHICLE PENDING FINALZE 

 

Dear Mr Sim/Jason, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 

1) SLL 3050E-DOA: 2/11/21 

2) SLG 2890E-DOA: 6/11/21 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


