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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 December 2021 15:00
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SGX592Z and S4246CD ( AIG ) , Dated : 16/11/2021 *** 

LKK REF:CC6/AIG21011718/ea3
Attachments: sgx592z.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Without Prejudice  
 
Dear Asher  
 
We submit our claim as follow: 
 
Repair cost S$ 3745.00 
Rental                  720.00 
 
 
Please let us have your offer to settle . 
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 18 November 2021 11:15 AM 
To: JIN AUTO SERVICES <jin@jinauto.com.sg> 
Cc: 'jouis' <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SGX592Z and S4246CD ( AIG ) , Dated : 16/11/2021 *** LKK 
REF:CC6/AIG21011718/ea3 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Hi Sir/Mdm,   
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  



18/11/2021



 
RELEASE VOUCHER 

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) 
 

 
“We/I, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have 
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK 
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for 
S$3,745.00 (Repair Cost), S$600.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S$  -   (Disbursement) for vehicle no. 
SGX 592Z that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 16/11/2021 (date) along 
NEWTON CIRCUS (location) involving vehicle no/s S 4246CD. This is pursuant to the 
inspection conducted on 18/11/2021 (date) at “the workshop”. 
 

 
We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner GOEI YING HAO DARYL (“the third 
party claimant”) of vehicle no. SGX 592Z make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and 
we/I have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I 
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”. 
 
We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, 
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party 
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and 
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the 
damage to SGX 592Z (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. 
 
We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the 
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a 
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.  
 
This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have 
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.  
 
 
Dated this ____ _____ (day) of _____________ (month) 20__ _ (year) 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

___ ____________________     ______________________________ 
Signed by appointed surveyor     Signed by “the workshop” (with chop) 

   22MAY06



AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

3745. 0000
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 18 November 2021 11:12 AM
To: YWHWANG19@MOFA.GO.KR
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING S 4246CD AND SGX 592Z ON 16/11/2021

Our Ref: CC6/AIG21011718/ea3 
                
 
18 NOV 2021 
                                       
HWANG YOUNG WOONG 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING S 4246CD AND SGX 592Z ON 16/11/2021 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the 
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please 
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD 
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
 
Asher 
Case Handler 
Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c.      AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd    
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
 






