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Re: Land Rover Defender, GBD5443C

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Mon 29/11/2021 10:07 AM
To:  See, Oliver <oliver.see@sg.sedgwick.com>
Cc:  assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

2 attachments (237 KB)
PRELI ADVISE GBD 5443C.pdf; Estimate.jpeg;

Dear Oliver,

We have received breakdown quotation from the workshop

Enclosed our preliminary advise and estimate of GBD 5443C

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 4:04 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; See, Oliver <oliver.see@sg.sedgwick.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Land Rover Defender, GBD5443C
 
Dear Oliver,

The survey has been conducted. 

According to our surveyor during the survey the breakdown quotation is not ready, will revert back to
you once is ready.

Yes, they have mention submitting claim related to loss of usage.


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 3:34 pm

To: See, Oliver <oliver.see@sg.sedgwick.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Land Rover Defender, GBD5443C
 
Dear Oliver
 
I have copied my colleague Denise, who is the handler for this case.
 
She will provide an update soon.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: See, Oliver <oliver.see@sg.sedgwick.com> 

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 3:13 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Land Rover Defender, GBD5443C
 
Dear Bryan
 
Further to the site appointment, any quote indicated the repair cost to be involved in this matter or further works
are required on this matter.
 
Meanwhile, did the claimant mentioned they would like to submit any claim related to loss of usage.
 
Thank you and have a blessed weekend.
 
Oliver See | Senior Loss Adjuster

Sedgwick Singapore Pte. Ltd.

30 Cecil Street | Level 12 | Prudential Tower | Singapore 049712

Phone: +65 6223 2008| Mobile: +65 8269 5062

EMAIL oliver.see@sg.sedgwick.com

www.sedgwick.com | Caring counts®

 
(** Note: Please be advised that effective 1st Nov 2019, Insight Adjusters and Surveyors Pte Ltd, Insight Marine Services Pte
Ltd, Insight Stallion Pte Ltd and Ship-Val (IMS) Pte Ltd are rebranded as Sedgwick. Hence, our Singapore Office has been re-
named as Sedgwick Singapore Pte. Ltd. While our brand name has been changed, we continue to provide professional loss
adjusting services as before and our commitment to you remains steadfast)
 
From: Patrick Waring <patrick@silverfoxstudios.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 16 November 2021 2:58 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; See, Oliver <oliver.see@sg.sedgwick.com>

Subject: Re: Land Rover Defender, GBD5443C
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Hi Bryan.
 
I have arranged for an appointment at “Moror Edgevantage” tomorrow morning at 9.00 am in line with your
requirements under. See attached address.
 
Regards,
 
Patrick Waring
Partner.
SILVERFOX STUDIOS PTE LTD Interior Architectural Design
www.silverfoxstudios.com.sg
 
Singapore - Head Office
2 Boon Leat Terrace, #08-04, 
Harbourside Building 2, Singapore 119844
Office Tel: +65 68832337 Fax: +65 68832737 H/P: +65 9780 0466
 
United Kingdom Office
Mildmay House, Church Lane, Twyford, Winchester, Hampshire, S021 1NT
Office Tel: +44 (0) 1962 715619
 
 
From: "Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)" <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Date: Tuesday, 16 November 2021 at 1:53 PM

To: "patrick@silverfoxstudios.com.sg" <patrick@silverfoxstudios.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Land Rover Defender, GBD5443C
 
Hi Patrick
 
As spoken a moment ago.
 
Please send your vehicle to your appointed repairer where we will carry out a damage assessment of
your vehicle.
 
Please also provide the date and time as well as the location once available.
 
Cc Assignment Team
 
Please arrange surveyor once further information is provided.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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