Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 10:10 AM
To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Request for finalization: GBB2205D
Attachments: GBB 2205 finalize (1).pdf

Hi Hui Zhen,

Workshop agreed finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com <kentsengcarservices@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 9:42 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for finalization: GBB2205D

Without Prejudice

Dear Steve

Good day,

Thank you for the finalization, we confirm LS COR:$2500 at 4 working days.
Thank You

Best Regards

Sebastian
Kent Seng Car Services



On 1/12/2021 8:48 pm, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) wrote:

Hi Sebastian,

Kindly refer our finalize $2500 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com <kentsengcarservices@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 December 2021 2:09 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Request for finalization: GBB2205D

Dear Steve

Good day,

Attachment is the after repair photo of GBB2205D for your perusal.
Kindly finalize the case with us at your earliest convenience.

Thank You

Best Regards

Sebastian
Kent Seng Car Services



