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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 25 February 2022 5:16 PM
To: Janet Tan
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO. SLR8795A AND PC4056H ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS 

SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore VOID DECK *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI21011635/Apa3
Attachments: DV_SLR8795A.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Janet, 
 
As spoken, we confirm settlement at $3,900.00(all-in). 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client’s letter of authority to us (LKK) for our 
necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 
From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 25 February 2022 4:02 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO. SLR8795A AND PC4056H ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore VOID 
DECK *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI21011635/Apa3 
 
Hi Hsiao, 
 
Please confirm accept below, thank you! 
 
Regards, 
Janet Tan  
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On Thu, Feb 24, 2022 at 3:52 PM Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao, 
 
Please confirm $4,000.00 (all-in). 
Thank you! 
 
Regards 
Janet Tan  
 
 
On Thu, Feb 24, 2022 at 8:39 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Janet, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,900.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 21 January 2022 1:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO. SLR8795A AND PC4056H ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore 
VOID DECK *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI21011635/Apa3 

  

Well noted with thanks, Hsiao Tong. 

  

Regards, 

Janet Tan  

  

On Fri, Jan 21, 2022 at 1:06 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Janet, 

  

We are preparing report to seek mandate from insurer. 

  

We will expedite and get back to you. 

  

Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 21 January 2022 1:00 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO. SLR8795A AND PC4056H ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore 
VOID DECK *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI21011635/Apa3 

  

Hi HT, 

  

Please advise below, thanks. 

  

Regards, 

Janet Tan 
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On Wed, Jan 12, 2022 at 8:21 AM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi HT, 

  

Kindly assist. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

From: Janet Tan [mailto:sltanjanettan@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, January 12, 2022 12:25 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO. SLR8795A AND PC4056H ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore 
VOID DECK 

  

DEAR LKK Admin, 
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Please ignore the previous invoice. 

Enclosed the CORRECT invoice attached. 

  

Thank you! 

  

Regards, 

Janet Tan  

  

  

  

On Wed, Jan 12, 2022 at 12:01 AM Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear LKK Team, 

  

RE:ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO. SLR8795A AND PC4056H ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore 
VOID DECK 

  

We act for MR. LEW KOK ON 
 the owner of motor vehicle no SLR8795A. 

  

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you/your insured in connection with a road traffic 
accident ON 12/11/2021 @0615HRS SENGKANG W WAY, Singapore VOID DECK involving our client's vehicle 
registration number SLR8795A and vehicle registration number PC4056H driven by your insured at the material time.  

  

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and /or management of your insured 
vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, 
particulars of which are as follow:- 

  

1.     Cost of Repair   (#0007)                                                                $3,600.00 

2.     Rental vehicle for 3 days @$330.00 per day                                 $.  330.00 

3.     Pre-Repair Survey Loss of Use for 2 days @$110.00 per day      $.  220.00.  
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4.     GIA report / LTA search 
fees                                                          $       7.49                                                                                                                     
                       

                                                                                                          Total.   $4,157.49 

We enclosed the above said-documents for your consideration.   

  

The demand herein is in respect of our client's claim for damages pertaining to his motor vehicle. Please acknowledge it 
upon receipt and let us have your settlement ASAP. 

 

  

Thank you! 

  

Regards, 

Janet Tan  

YSK AUTO WORKSHOP  

HP#9248 1057 

  

  


