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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 23 June 2022 11:27 AM
To: Samuel Kang
Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBK2316U// DOA: 23/10/2021 // LKK Ref: 

CC4/AIG21011634/Rps3(AIG-SLH1473C)
Attachments: DV_GBK 2316U.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We confirm settlement at $2,300.50(all-in). 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Samuel Kang <samuel@westpointgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 June 2022 5:26 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBK2316U// DOA: 23/10/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21011634/Rps3(AIG-SLH1473C) 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
 
Noted with thanks. Kindly proceed. Attached is the scan copy of the chopped and signed copy of the consent. 
Once again so sorry for the delay. 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify  
that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
Samuel Kang 
M -  9722 2822 
T   - 6259 9433 
A  - 19 Jurong Port Road, S 619093 
 
 
 
On Wed, 22 Jun 2022 at 10:56, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Samuel, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 1,979.50  

2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00)(w/GST)  $    321.00  

Total  $ 2,300.50  

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

Attached is a copy of LOD for your necessary action. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Samuel Kang <samuel@westpointgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 June 2022 3:57 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBK2316U// DOA: 23/10/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21011634/Rps3(AIG-SLH1473C) 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Please find attached copy of the rental agreement for your perusal, as for the LOD we had a conversation over the 
phone you told me that i can just type it out right? In what format or what details will i have to do it? 

I would like to claim for a lump sum as stated and the rental coverage. 

So sorry for the inconvenience, as the previous guy left without a proper handover. Thank you so much for your 
kind understanding and patience .  

  

 
 

 

Samuel Kang 

M -  9722 2822 
T   - 6259 9433 

A  - 19 Jurong Port Road, S 619093 
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On Tue, 21 Jun 2022 at 11:44, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Samuel, 

  

Kindly let us have a copy of the following document: - 

  

 Rental Agreement 
 Letter of Demand (LOD) 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 May 2022 4:35 PM 
To: Samuel Kang <samuel@westpointgroup.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBK2316U// DOA: 23/10/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21011634/Rps3(AIG-SLH1473C) 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Samuel, 

  

As spoken, kindly let us have a copy of the following document: - 

  

 Rental Agreement 
 Letter of Demand (LOD) 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Samuel Kang <samuel@westpointgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 May 2022 1:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBK2316U// DOA: 23/10/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21011634/Rps3(AIG-SLH1473C) 

  

Your Ref: GBK2316U// DOA: 23/10/2021 // LKK Ref: 
CC4/AIG21011634/Rps3(AIG-SLH1473C) 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Attached are the documents needed to be submitted for GBK2316U. 

So sorry as it took sometime as the guy in charge has left without handing over so we have to get it sorted one by 
one. Utmost sincere apologies. 

  

 
 

Samuel Kang 

M -  9722 2822 
T   - 6259 9433 

A  - 19 Jurong Port Road, S 619093 

  

  

  

On Wed, 27 Apr 2022 at 11:23, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 
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Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) 
to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

  

Thank you. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  


