Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 December 2021 3:30 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: [EXTERNAL] - Accident Involving Vehicle SDV2272E and GZ1281D (INDIA
INSURED ) ON 12/11/2021

Attachments: sgx592z.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Without prejudice
Dear Summer

WE submit our claim as follow :
Repair cost $55403.50
Rental 720.00

Please let us have your offer to settle.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Motor Claim - Il [mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 11:00 AM

To: JIN AUTO SERVICES <jin@jinauto.com.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; Summer (LKK Auto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'jouis' <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>; Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - Accident Involving Vehicle SDV2272E and GZ1281D (INDIA INSURED ) ON 12/11/2021

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SDV2272E and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Aida.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen. Please check with workshop if they have negotiated any COR settlement with our insured.

Thank You.

Bhuvaneswari



JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
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Signed By :

Registration Number __~° Sy LAY T’/ have been adv!sed by them and understand the
content of my/our motor clalm as spedfv herein:

Fype of Claim : D Claim Own-Policy Only
{77 Direct settiement With Third Party Insurer

A compulsory poficy excess stated in the Motor Policy taken up by you is

applicable for own damage claim.

Yau have my/our full authority to negotiate a settlement with the third party and/or
his/her/thelr Insurers on such terms as you deem fit. Upon settiement of my/our claim, you are
authorised to sign any Discharge Voucher or any document to confirm my/four acceptance of
the settlement as full and final discharge of my/our claim, on my/four behalf.

Loss Of Use and Cost Of Rental shall be computed in accordance to the number of days as
recommended by the surveyor and the benchmark rates published in State Court Practice
Direction for Non-Injury Motor Accident {(NiMA] Claims.

I/We, am/are fully aware that Jin Auto Services Pig u& is assisting me/usin nw{wr'!'hlrd Party
insurer, I/ We shail release Jin Auto Services Pte Lid a:ainﬂ any liabliity, foss claim or
proceedings which may arise out of or in the course of or by reason of execution of the services.

In the event that Third Party Insurer Is not prepared to settle the clalm due to breach of policy
or other reasons, you may without referring to us to commence legal proceedings against Third
Party on our behalfto recover the damages. }/We shall render my/our co-operation for the
legal clsim process. The entire amount ciaimed shaif belong and make payable to Jin Auto
Services Pte 1id absolutely.
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INDIA INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

° @] |NTERNATIONAL Co. Reg. No. 198703792k | GST. Reg. No. M2-0078806-X
I 64 | Cecil Street | #04 | #05 | #06-02 | IOB Building | Singapore 049711
( NSURANCE Office (65) 63476100  Email  insure@iii.com.sg
SINGAPORE

Serving the region since 1987 Fax (65) 62244174 Website www.iii.com.sg

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MFL2021D0004978
Claimant Ref :SDV 2272E

Well, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement
with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$ 6,000.00 (gl?rgzpauli%— h .

Y

IS e————ieey, \/chiCle no.SDV 2272I-:'that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on_12/11/2021 (date) at YIO CHU KANG RD TOWARDS CTE (CITY) (location) involving vehicle no. GZ 1281 IQinsured

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 15/11/2021 (date) at “the workshop”.

Wel/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LEE TECK HUAT ADRIAN ("the third party

claimant") of vehicle no. 6 make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle

the matter on his/her behalf in @ manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third
party claimant”.

Wel/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that
they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant" after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss
of use pursuant to the damage toSDV 2272'%\/ehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of "the third party claimant"
pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability
basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out of the same.

We/l authorize you to pay the totalamount of S$ 6,00000 to JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Dated this 18 .....

CLAIMANT: WITNESS:
Signature: Signature: %
Signed by appointed Surveyor
Name: JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD Name: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NRIC: 2XXXXX370C NRIC: 199607198R
Address: BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10 #01-412  Address: 51 UBI AVE 1#01-25 PAYA LEBAR IND'L PARK
SINGAPORE 539195 SINGAPORE 408933
Nationality: Nationality:

Occupation: Occupation:




. Jin Auto SEervices P1e L1p
SEAABIRO 351 itz Dets Lane 10 Sinsspore 3915

Email: jin@jinauto.com.sg
Company Reg. No: 200704370C GST Reg. No: 200704370C
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21 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1
SINGAPORE 798125
TEL: 6383 2661 FAX: 6484 2836

REG. NO. 430058/00D No. 2089 b
OFFICIAL RECEIPT
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@
DAWN ENTERPRISES
21 Seletar West Farmway 1
Singapore 798125 NO 3 8 0 2 4
Tel: 63832661 Fax: 64842836
Reg No.430058/00D

\’}\\\ \ )
RENTAL AGREEMENT DATE _~ ~

HIRER’S PARTICULARS

DRIVER’S PARTICULARS

= T a1 ATRIAN AR (RER.
Name LCE e : Nemig —— . " _Hh_i, R
Address 3 ,5 MPP’&?\ EA'S;( CMT o g i Address e —_—
. mna ke SR el ) S e
Smee  4bb444 o _ —
I/C or Passport No. Slq' {2390 Country _Q_L___ﬁ GHPRE I/C or Passport No. —— Country —_—
Occupation Occupation -_— O
Date of Birtn___~SI9F] Q6o b o DateofBith— a4 .
e LjoS f1a& .
Driving Licence No. . Date Passed 3_[_ / i Driving Licence No. _____ Boeboesed - e
Tel: (HP) (Residence) _ 8318 2023 Tel: (Office) (Residence)
IMPORTANT NOTES: - | CHARGES
1 No Insurance Coverage if the driver is below 24yrs old or less than 2 years driving licence. —F = [ & 1 e ¥
2 This vehicle is licenced to carry passengers only. (~Day at $ 3 W per days Eb ? '“ﬂ—/d \ T
3 Hirer s iable to pay first § 9 ﬂ 0 D as excess all ¢laims any accident plus loss —L?'J— S ﬁ{———ﬂz 2
of earning while damaged véhicle is under repair. Day at $ per week
4 Forusage to Malaysta suject to higher excass all claims of $$5,000.00 and different rental rate — —
5 Please notify our office should there be any accident involving this hired vehicle within 24 hrs Day at $ per month
6 No refund will be given for vehicle retums early. o — —
7 Norefund will be given for petro! left in vehicle.
8  Hireris liable to pay all parking fee and traffic summonses.
9 Vehicles to be return during office hour only. T 2 ¢ ]
10 No Service on Public Holiday and Sunday. TOTAL AMOUNT E "’U i -
SCHEDULE ]
AMOUNT PAID
BALANCE DUE :
Days Extension From To

Amount Deposit (refundable) $ l

1] 1} | 20y

TO

(& [ 1] 202

I/we have read and understood the terms and conditions
above and hereby agreed to abide

-_— s -

Hirer's Signature Driver/Gurantor's Signature DAWN ENTERPRISES




2/21/22, 10:46 AM

Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SDV2272E (MFL2021D0004978)
[GZ1281D]
TP
LEE TECK HUAT ADRIAN
Nov 12 2021 4:00PM

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (IlI_SG), sent on 14/02/2022 17:12 PM.

To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$6003.50) - SDV2272E - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Approved:6003.50.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print& CFID=92150603&CFTOKEN=2d753df88c3ec9f7-050...
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