4/7/22, 2:57 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

5E%2: SGW 2204 L HONDA CIVIC ---- FINALIZE

Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Thu 7/4/2022 1:24 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Zl%EA: claims@rico60.com <claims@rico60.com>

B&i%: 2022F4H7H 13:24:25 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

1% A Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; 'Enquiry' <enquiry@rico60.com>
ZFERE: RE: SGW 2204 L HONDA CIVIC ---- FINALIZE

Dear Guo Qiang,
Offer accepted.

Thank you .

RICO

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 7, 2022 12:49 PM

To: Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@rico60.com>

Subject: [7] & : SGW 2204 L HONDA CIVIC ---- FINALIZE

Hi,

“Without Prejudice”
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $4400 /- with 6 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

KA N : Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>

K IEW ] 202243 H 7H 14:20

W N : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao
Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK
Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

¥ 1% : 'Claims' <claims@rico60.com>

@ : RE: SGW 2204 L HONDA CIVIC ---- FINALIZE

Dear Guo Qjang,

Kindly advise if the finalization offer is ready for this case.

Thank You

Best Regards,
https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKkAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYtNGE3OCO5NWVKLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIXNAAQABIi57BIM31VIpyltCAK7MIQ... 1/2



4/7/22, 2:57 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

From: Rico 60 Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Friday, February 25, 2022 8:30 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
<jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Rico 60 Enquiry
<enquiry@rico60.com>

Subject: SGW 2204 L HONDA CIVIC ---- FINALIZE

hi Ikk guo giang
REMINDER FOR FINALIZATION

attached after paint AND check item

Pls check & revert to us soon.
hope to hear from you finalize offer soon

Thank you

Regards,
roco60 x

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com
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