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Print Received Message
This mail is associated with :
*SKV3380L (C0398810)
[SDA7954Z]
TP
TAN ENG TECK
Sep 52016 6:00PM
[HUNG, CHING MAN]
New Hock Teck Motor Workshop
From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 02/10/2017 22:21 PM.
To LKK_HQ
CcC AXA SG; jaskhine@lkkauto.com
Subject Re: Fw: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%
Hi Jas,
Yes, you may proceed to temporarily close the file if no development by 18/10/2017.
We shall wait if matter litigates, and ensure Ol is aware of her involvement may be required.
Thank you.
With regards,
Ernest
<-- Original Message -->
From: LKK_HQ
To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG
CC: jaskhine@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 02/10/2017 05:02 PM
Subject: Re: Fw: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%
Dear Ernest,
Futher to the below matter.
So further TP still not accept our offer 50% and no further development since 18/07/2017.
Kindly advise your instruction whether we may close the file temporary if TP do not revert by
18/10/2017.
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Jas Khine | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
<-- Original Message -->
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com; AXA_SG
CC: jaskhine@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 30/09/2017 06:15 PM
Subject: Re: Fw: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%
Dear LKK team,
Please confirm if TP has accepted our offer or have we reject them.
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Thank you.

With regards,
Ernest

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

CC: AXA_SG; jaskhine@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 18/07/2017 05:53 PM

Subject: Re: Fw: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%

m redefining /insurance

Dear Jas,

As spoken, we will maintain to offer at 50% based on BOLA S24a.
If TP still refuse; they may proceed to escalate for litigation.
Kindly also inform insured of the same.

Thank you.

With regards,

Ernest

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG

CC: jaskhine@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 14/06/2017 05:18 PM

Subject: Fw: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%
Dear Ernest,

Further to the below matter.

Kindly advise your further instruction urgently to maintain our stand or revise offer as TP repairer
threatern us that they are going to pass the case to their solicitor for further handling.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->
From: LKK_HQ
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To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; jaskhine@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 13/02/2017 06:48 PM

Subject: Fw: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%

Dear Ernest,

Further to the below matter.

Kindly advise your further instruction to maintain our stand or revise offer.

Kindly revert urgently as TP repairer keeps calling us and asking for our revise offer.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG

CC: jaskhine@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 23/01/2017 03:37 PM

Subject: TP REJECTED OUR OFFER AND INSISTED FOR 100%

Dear Ernest,
Further to the below matter.

We had offered to TP repairer 50% of liabiltiy as instructed. However, TP rejected our offer and
insisted for 100% as they claimed that their client's vehicle was fully stationary at the time of collision
and hit by our insured vehicle.

We have reviewed the matter and would like to highlight you that at the time of the impact/collision TP
vehicle was fully stopped and even horned at insured vehicle. However, insured reversed with high
speed and collided to TP vehicle. Therefore, we are of the opinion that insured is more liable causing
the accident.

Kindly advise your further instruction to maintain our stand or revise offer.
Thank you.
“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year”

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 06/10/2016 10:54 AM

Subject: DS
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POCA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
= (65) 6338 7288
Z (65) 6338 2522

WA A0 A DO S

M redefining / insurance

Dear Jas,

As spoken, TP video supported BOLA S25 - both parties reverse or moving out of parking lot. Engaged
insured consent to settle at 50%.

Thank you.

With regards,
Ernest

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp ... 8/12/2017



