Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 November 2021 7:10 PM

To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: SFW 1801G - NG CHUN KEONG | DOA : 08/11/2021 | REF. NO. :
SNM21D206393/C02/LEWLC

Attachments: SFW 1801 finalize (1).pdf

Hi Hui Zhen,

Workshop agreed finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <claims@chengauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 November 2021 11:40 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SFW 1801G - NG CHUN KEONG | DOA : 08/11/2021 | REF. NO. : SNM21D206393/C02/LEWLC

Dear Mr Steve Chen,

Thank you for making an offer.

We accept $4750 (L/S, before GST). 5 repair days.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Claims Department
Rachel Las



CHENG AU

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 1:10 PM

To: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Subject: SFW 1801G - NG CHUN KEONG | DOA : 08/11/2021 | REF. NO. : SNM21D206393/C02/LEWLC

Hi Rachel,

Kindly refer our finalize $4750 (L/S, before GST). 5 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 11:59 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SFW 1801G - NG CHUN KEONG | DOA : 08/11/2021 | REF. NO. : SNM21D206393/C02/LEWLC

Dear Steve,
Attached herewith he after repair photos for your reference.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department
Rachel Las

CHENG AU



CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>
Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 7:31 pm

To: Steve Chen (stevechen@Ikkauto.com) <stevechen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SFW 1801G - NG CHUN KEONG | DOA : 08/11/2021 | REF. NO

Dear Steve,
Attached herewith the checked item photos for your reference.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department
Rachel Las

CHENG AU
CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

Reporting Centre
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-60 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607
Email: claims@chengauto.com

Workshop
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-62 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607
Email: cab@chengauto.com

Spraypainting
Address: 1 Soon Lee Street #06-41 Pioneer Centre, Singapore 627605
Email: cab@chengauto.com

.:SNM21D206393/C02/LEWLC



