Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 12:01 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

From: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 12:00:47 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Please close as per your finalization, please advice LOD to be sent over to LKK or insurance, thank you for your
kind attention.

Regards
Wendy siew

On and behalf of

Kian teong auto centre

Blk 176 sin Ming drive

Sin Ming auto care #01-02/08
Singapore 575721

Mobile: 91786498

Office: 64556268

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 5/25/22 9:37 AM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Hi Wendy,

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-



From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 11:31 am

To: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject:Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Hi Wendy,

refer to attachment

As spoken, | checked and revised the amount,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $4,200.00 /- with 03 days of
repair, subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 10:12 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject:Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G
We are unable to absorb the price for the door trim.
Regards

Wendy siew

On and behalf of

Kian teong auto centre

Blk 176 sin Ming drive

Sin Ming auto care #01-02/08

Singapore 575721

Mobile: 91786498



Office: 64556268

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 5/18/22 9:55 AM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Without damage photo, I'm unable to justify

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 9:53 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject:Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

We do not hold any photos, please assist to check as the parts is confirm installed in the car. The door is
damaged together with the trim, we definity need to change it as we are change the whole door unit

Regards
Wendy siew

On and behalf of

Kian teong auto centre

Blk 176 sin Ming drive

Sin Ming auto care #01-02/08
Singapore 575721

Mobile: 91786498

Office: 64556268

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 5/18/22 9:48 AM
To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Hi Wendy,

rear door inner trim no damage photo

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 9:27 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject:Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G
Dear Sir,

Please assist to check the door trim is changed.

Regards
Wendy siew

On and behalf of

Kian teong auto centre

Blk 176 sin Ming drive

Sin Ming auto care #01-02/08
Singapore 575721

Mobile: 91786498

Office: 64556268

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 5/17/22 9:56 AM
To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Hi Wendy,

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 May 2022 5:28 pm



To: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject:Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Hi Wendy,

Kindly check and acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 May 2022 11:48 am

To: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject:Re: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Hi Wendy,

refer to attachment

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $4,050.00 /- with 03 days of
repair, subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 November 2021 12:25 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject:RE: ESTIMATE FOR LAND ROVER GBG 696 G

Please assist to finalize ASAP

Regards
Wendy siew



On and behalf of

Kian teong auto centre

Blk 176 sin Ming drive

Sin Ming auto care #01-02/08
Singapore 575721

Mobile: 91786498

Office: 64556268



