










Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 10 Nov 2021 / 15:35:52

Receipt Date/Time : 10 Nov 2021 / 15:35:43

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-211110-002536

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKN3207Y
As at 06 Nov 2021/18:50:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insurance Enquiry - SKN3207Y
Enquiry Fee 
20211110153335842322

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

451297XXXXXX2319 eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.



1

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 January 2022 1:51 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

*** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3

Lonpac External - General 

 

Our Ref : 20/21/21/VP05/025129 

 

Dear Jaslin, 

 

Please proceed as proposed. 

 

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: CHEW BENG KEE <bkchew@lonpac.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Tuesday, 18 January 2022 1:37 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Hi Gerald 

 

OK, pls proceed with TPPD claims settlement as proposed. 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards 

Mr Chew Beng Kee 

Head of Claims | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 246 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

 
In view of the revised measures under Transition Phase of COVID-19 restrictions effective 22 November 

2021, 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in our replies, payments and 

claims settlements during this period. Your understanding is greatly appreciated and we apologise for 

any inconvenience caused. 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Tuesday, 18 January 2022 1:08 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: CHEW BENG KEE <bkchew@lonpac.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Lonpac External - General 

 

Hi Chew, 

 

Attached supporting documents for DS for your approval. 

 

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Tuesday, 18 January 2022 12:12 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm,  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN 3207Y (LPC) AND GBJ 9289Z (TP) ON 06/11/2021 

We refer to the above matter. 

OI reversing & collided with TP’s stationary vehicle. 

We seek your approval to offer repairer “ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD " at $ 1,451.95 (all-in). 

The summary is as follows: - 

   
Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair $ 3,916.30 $ 1,123.50 (1,050.00 7%GST) 

2. Loss of Rental (2 days x $150.00) (W/GST) $ 321.00 $ 321.00 (2 days x $150.00) (W/GST) 

3. LTA / GIA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45 

Surveyor recommended 2 days for repair. 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
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Kindly let us have your approval
approvalapproval

approval / instruction. 

 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From:

From:From:

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 17 November 2021 11:15 AM 

To:

To:To:

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Lonpac External - General 

 

Dear Jaslin, 
 
We have given the insured’s report to you.  
 
TP states that he has a in-car camera in his police report. 
                                                                                                                                                         

                                                                                                                                                         

                               
    
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 17 November 2021 11:08 am 

To:

To:To:

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Dear Gerald 
 
We are trying to get TP’s video footage. 
 
Kindly advice if any clearer sketch and description of the accident. 
 
 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 
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Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From:

From:From:

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 17 November 2021 10:47 AM 

To:

To:To:

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Lonpac External - General 

 

 
Dear Jaslin, 
 
Please let us have your view on liability as our insured maintained that he is not at fault. 
 
As the policy is due for renewal, please advise our liability as soon as possible. 
 
If there is a need to engage insured, please proceed. 
 
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 

“

““

“In view of the revised measures for COVID-19 restrictions effective 27 September 2021, 

more than 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in our replies, 

payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding is greatly appreciated 

and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”
””

”. 

 

 

 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Tuesday, 16 November 2021 5:09 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
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Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC21011502/Gra3  

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- TP estimated cost of repair 
- Preliminary advice 
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition 

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jaslin. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  

  

 Submission of 

Submission of Submission of 

Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience cause

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience causeclaim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience cause

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

d is much regrettedd is much regretted

d is much regretted.

..

. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Thursday, 11 November, 2021 9:38 AM 

To:

To:To:

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments 

<assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 

We will proceed to conduct after repair inspection today. 

 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi 

Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Thursday, 11 November, 2021 9:25 AM 
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To:

To:To:

To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

 

Lonpac External - General 

 

Our Ref        : 20/21/21/VP05/025127 
 
Dear Summer, 
 
According to the workshop, our insured intend to do a private settlement but change his mind later. 
 

 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 9:17 am 

To:

To:To:

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Please be informed that according to the repairer, the vehicle had completed its repairs. We will proceed 

to conduct after repair inspection today. 

 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi 

Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 10 November, 2021 5:33 PM 

To:

To:To:

To: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

 

Lonpac External - General 

 

 
Our Ref        : 20/21/21/VP05/025129 
 

 
Dear Summer, 
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FYA. Attached copy of insured report. 
 

 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 

“

““

“In view of the revised measures for COVID-19 restrictions effective 27 September 2021, 

more than 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in our replies, 

payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding is greatly appreciated 

and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”
””

”. 

 

 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From:

From:From:

From: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg <taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 10 November 2021 5:07 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

 

Dear Mr. Gerald , 

 

We would choose LKK to be the surveyor. 

 

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our vehicle at 25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598 

 

Regards 

 

Lay Bee 

 

From:

From:From:

From: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg <taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 10 November 2021 4:23 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com' <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving Vehicle Nos. GBJ9289E & SKN3207Y at Blk 245 Simei Street 5 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We are the registered owner of vehicle number GBJ9289Z which was involved on the above mentioned accident. 

 

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number SKN3207Y was insured with you at the material time of 

the said accident. We enclosed hereby the GIA report of GBJ9289Z for your kind attention. 
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As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured vehicle 

number SKN3207Y, therefore , we are holding you liable for the repair costs and other consequential loss 

which was sustained by us. 

 

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our vehicle as soon as possible.  

 

 

Thank you & regards 

 

 

Lay Bee

Lay BeeLay Bee

Lay Bee 

 

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598 

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office)  l +65 6747 7791 (Fax)  

Email: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg 

 

 

Disclaimer: 

This email, including all the attachments, is solely for the attention and use of the individual or entity 

to whom it is addressed and may contain information that is privileged,  

confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. 

If you are not the intended addressee(s) of this email, you must not use, disseminate, forward, print or 

copy this email and all its contents/attachments. 

If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately by return email and delete 

the original message 

 

 

 

 

 


	79baa813426844b317a5ccd7a9430f7132eed4d995137dbb503959086068d59e.pdf
	2995a2fa5a9c87992660f99857ec80b9fad706dfb360c648405a3fb1d3791e68.pdf
	c48146bae40e59e7ea72214730c7aea44b39e1c727e33cccb0c405e181e472fe.pdf

	dedb0cef09cfd73a1e1a66b25d9fd4c79f9ef6242a356c68f99ef84db93c6769.pdf

	b720851d8aa85f00478156d9f96b0a5eb26f635591e8579cd4ac0d19ff43ffe3.pdf
	79baa813426844b317a5ccd7a9430f7132eed4d995137dbb503959086068d59e.pdf
	2995a2fa5a9c87992660f99857ec80b9fad706dfb360c648405a3fb1d3791e68.pdf
	c48146bae40e59e7ea72214730c7aea44b39e1c727e33cccb0c405e181e472fe.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style



