Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, November 11, 2021 9:58 AM

To: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg; assignments; Admin A; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); Guo Qiang
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle GBJ9289E

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Lay Bee,

Kindly forward the before and after repair photos, together with our estimation for you to evaluate.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg <taylaybee @abwinleasing.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 November, 2021 6:00 PM

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle GBJ9289E

Dear Summer,

Initially, the driver of SKN3207Y agreed to go on private settlement. So, we sent the vehicle to the workshop for repair.

This morning he told us to make TP claim. In this respect, the vehicle which you will be surveying is a after repair
vehicle.

Just wonder if we could forward you the before and after repair photos, together with our estimation for you to
evaluate, sine the damage is minor.

Please advise.
Regards

Lay Bee

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 November 2021 5:49 pm




To: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg
Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle GBJ9289E

Dear Lay Bee,

May | know have provide estimate and do DS with us?

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg <taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 November, 2021 5:48 PM

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle GBJ9289E

Dear Summer,

Vehicle no. GBJ9289E will only be in our workshop tomorrow morning. Perhaps you can arrange to drop by in the
afternoon.

Regards

Lay Bee

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 November 2021 5:37 pm

To: taylaybee@abwinleasing.sg

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Survey Vehicle GBJ9289E

Dear Lay Bee,

Is the vehicle GBJ 9289E in the workshop?

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



