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Dear Mr Wong

 

Kindly refer attachment debit Note for repair cost of GBJ9289Z.

 

Abwin Leasing Pte Ltd

DBS current A/C 0029065570 or Pay now to UEN: 201223082ZALP

Warmest Regards,

 

Josiah Lee

Credit Collection Officer

+65 88683156

 

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office)  l +65 6747 7791 (Fax) 

EMAIL: enquiry@abwinleasing.sg

 

 

Disclaimer:

This email, including all the attachments, is solely for the attention and use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged,

confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law.

If you are not the intended addressee(s) of this email, you must not use, disseminate, forward, print or copy this email and all its contents/attachments.

If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately by return email and delete the original message
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