1/12/22, 9:01 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

FW: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Rasul (LKKAuto)
Mon 10/1/2022 5:46 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Case finalised

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 7 January, 2022 2:25 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

please close as per your finalise, LOD to me sent over to your side?

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@]lkkauto.com>
Sent: 1/4/22 3:43 PM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Hi Wendy,

No photo we unable to accept it

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwWMGFhNWIXNAAQAOMd7fDAOatFg3f8...  1/5
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

i

|7 g n R
== o Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 January, 2022 10:41 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

sorry we did not take any ohotos

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 12/27/21 1:21 PM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Hi Wendy,

Kindly forward to me the damage photo for the front bumper cover?

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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1/12/22, 9:01 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 27 December, 2021 12:28 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

the invoice is for SLU9923A, YOU CAN CHECK THE SPARE PART NUMBER, SUPPLIER'S INV
DOES NOT HAVE CAR PLATE NUMBER FIELD.

Yours faithfully
Wendy Siew
On and behalf of
Kian Teong Auto Centre
176 Sin Ming Drive
Sin Ming autocare #01-08
Singapore 575721
Tel: 65 64556268
Fax: 65 64555166
HP: 91786498
Website:www.ktauto.com.sg

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@]lkkauto.com>
Sent: 12/21/21 10:10 AM
To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Hi Wendy,

Invoice didn’t show vehicle number

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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1/12/22, 9:01 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 20 December, 2021 2:43 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Pls refer to the inv attached, front bumper cover changed

Yours faithfully
Wendy Siew
On and behalf of
Kian Teong Auto Centre
176 Sin Ming Drive
Sin Ming autocare #01-08
Singapore 575721
Tel: 65 64556268
Fax: 65 64555166
HP: 91786498
Website:www.ktauto.com.sg

From: "Rasul (LKKAuto)" <Rasul@]lkkauto.com>
Sent: 12/20/21 12:47 PM
To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Hi Wendy,

Refer to attachment
Audit checked parts prices is high, necessary adjustment has to be made.
Finalised amount is $ 2,850 / 4 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm and revert back
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Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 9 December, 2021 11:38 AM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: ESTIMATE FOR SLU9923A

Please assist to finalise estimate ASAP

Yours faithfully
Wendy Siew
On and behalf of
Kian Teong Auto Centre
176 Sin Ming Drive
Sin Ming autocare #01-08
Singapore 575721
Tel: 65 64556268
Fax: 65 64555166
HP: 91786498
Website:www.ktauto.com.sg
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