Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Christina <christina@1ap.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 6:31 PM
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SCE2218P BMW 216D

Dear Sirs,

We confirm COR @ $5000 and DOR @ 5 days.
We'll forward our LOD to Income in due course.

Thanks and best regards,

Christina Tan

Business Development Manager

1st Auto Pro Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Office @ #01-49 | Ws @ #01-51 & 52
Singapore 415875 | DID: 9188 3197

On 1 Nov 2022, at 1:08 PM, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Christina,
“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair $5000/- with 5 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang



