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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 12 November 2021 1:37 PM
To: 'Alka Kapoor'
Cc: Alka Kapoor
Subject: RE: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE4315J(AIG) AND SGZ9359L 

AT/ALONG CLEMENTI ROAD ON 04/11/2021
Attachments: SGZ9359L Video.mp4

Dear Ms Alika Kappor, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that we do not have a good defense towards the claim 
submitted by SGZ9359L. Attached here with a copy of video from car camera of SGZ9359L for your easy reference. 
Based on all available information on hand, we can agree on the following: - 
 

1. third party completed U-turn and driving straight,  
2. your vehicle was coming out from slip road with give way sign. 

 
Kindly refer to the below google map for your easy reference. Your vehicle was coming out from slip road should 
give way to the vehicle who was driving along main road.  
 

 
 
We attach a copy of MAG Scenario 15(c) for your reference. Any vehicle approaching the major road from a minor 
road should give way to oncoming traffic on the major road. You may also note that MAG is widely used in court for 
liability assessment. 
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Furthermore, the damages sustained to third party vehicle was on left rear side and your vehicle damages was on 
front right side. The damage profile to both vehicles suggested that third party had already driven pass and hit by 
your vehicle. 
 
In view of the above, we regret to inform that we do not have a good case to defense and will have to proceed to 
settle the claim at best terms. However, you may choose to claim Third Party insurance for excess/uninsured losses. 
If you managed to claim 80% or above, please send us the supporting documents and AIG will review the matter. 
 
Thank you.  
 
“The video footage is confidential information and is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced.  You undertake to 
preserve its confidentiality and will not disclose, provide or make available the video footage in whole or in part, to any third 
party.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Alka Kapoor <kapooralka@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 10:20 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Alka Kapoor <alkamalhotra.kapoor@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE4315J(AIG) AND SGZ9359L AT/ALONG CLEMENTI ROAD 
ON 04/11/2021 
 
Dear Ms. Chew, 
 
I am attaching another wider photo of the site of the accident in case it is helpful. 
 
Thank you! 
Warm regards, 
Alka Kapoor 
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Thank you and best regards, 
Alka Kapoor 
 

On 11 Nov 2021, at 9:31 PM, Alka Kapoor 
<alkamalhotra.kapoor@gmail.com> wrote: 

  
Dear Ms. Chew, 
 
I am also attaching a picture of where we both stopped our cars after the 
accident, taken by my daughter after the accident. As you can see from 
the position and the debris even after we moved forward to come to a 
stop, the accident happened while we were still turning left in the third 
lane, and the other gentleman had to have u-turned at a high speed to 
have hit us all the way in the third lane there.  
 
Please see where the debris is in the photo, and note that we had both 
already moved a bit further ahead to stop our cars. Please also note that 
the metal on our bumper was torn and pulled outwards from the speed of 
his car and shear forces on the metal - it should have been dented or 
pushed inwards if we had hit him. 
 
Thank you! 
Warm Regards, 
Alka Kapoor 
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On 11 Nov 2021, at 12:04 PM, Alka Kapoor 
<kapooralka@hotmail.com> wrote: 

  
Dear Ms. Chew, 
 
Further to our telephone conversation, please find some 
photos below. 
 
 
My car 
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The gentleman’s car 
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Thank you so much for your help and support! 
Warm regards, 
Alka Kapoor 
 

On 11 Nov 2021, at 11:43 AM, Hsiao Tong 
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  
11 Nov 2021 
                                                                
Ms Alika Kappor                                              [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SKE4315J 
Our Ref: CC3/AIG21011319/pa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE4315J(AIG) AND SGZ9359L AT/ALONG 
CLEMENTI ROAD ON 04/11/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that 
we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia 
Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against 
your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SGZ9359L against your insurance 
policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the 
view that we do not have a good defense towards the claim 
submitted by third party (SGZ9359L). Under Motor Accident Guide, 
third party completed the U-turn and travelling straight on the 
major road has the right of way. Your vehicle was approaching to 
major road from minor road should give way to oncoming traffic on 
the major road.  
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 
of the third-party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which 
would escalate to even more cost. Please be assured that we will do 
our due diligence to mitigate the cost. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to 
our negotiations and settlement, please contact us within 07 days 
from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be 
affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party claim. However, 
if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized 
for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
  
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  



4/21/22, 3:19 PM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1043702&extid=373036&CFID=93… 1/2

 

Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> SARAVANAN S/O GOVINDASAMY. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(206863) AUDI A4 2.0 TFSI S-TRONIC (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Clm Created Reg No: SGZ9359L. Acct Date: 2021/11/04. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt
d. (SG). TP Insurer: Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/11/16 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
05 Nov
2021
22:57

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> ADRIAN LING [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
11 Nov
2021
11:16

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

12
12 Nov
2021
13:29

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

13
17 Nov
2021
16:12

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:20:00:00->21:00:00.

[I] AIG
OneClaim

Integration
User

14
26 Jan
2022
11:50

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
26 Jan
2022
11:50

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
26 Jan
2022
11:50

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2020/12/29.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
26 Jan
2022
11:50

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
28 Jan
2022
10:01

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:20311.76:Liability: 100%(B11c)
*Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $18,059.76 + (b)LOR(15days x $1
50.00): $2.250.00 + (c)Search fee: $2.00= Total: $20,311.76
*13 recommendation repair days + 2Su
nday = 15days
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

19
02 Mar
2022
11:22

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Lee, Ming-

Yao

20
02 Mar
2022
11:29

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/11/16. Mandate Remarks: To offer LOR @ $120/day or lumpsum at
$20,000.00

[I] Lee, Ming-
Yao

21
02 Mar
2022
11:29

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:20000.00:To offer LOR @ $120/day or lumpsum at $20,000.00 [I] Lee, Ming-

Yao

22
21 Mar
2022
10:52

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:20311.76:For LOR, 3rd party insisted to claim for $150/day x 15days. Total amount $20,311.7
6(all-in). For your further mandate.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

23
12 Apr
2022
08:58

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Loh, Chee-

Heng

24
12 Apr
2022
09:02

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:20311.76. [I] Loh, Chee-

Heng

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=93698111&CFTOKEN=129e73c5b119943e-DD8D1C5A-C1A5-CEE2-2ABF9FFAB42F1F87&USID=3251&RID=9701135
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=93698111&CFTOKEN=129e73c5b119943e-DD8D1C5A-C1A5-CEE2-2ABF9FFAB42F1F87&USID=3251&RID=9701135
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=93698111&CFTOKEN=129e73c5b119943e-DD8D1C5A-C1A5-CEE2-2ABF9FFAB42F1F87&USID=3251&RID=9701135
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=93698111&CFTOKEN=129e73c5b119943e-DD8D1C5A-C1A5-CEE2-2ABF9FFAB42F1F87&USID=3251&RID=9701135&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1043702%26extid%3D373036%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=93698111&CFTOKEN=129e73c5b119943e-DD8D1C5A-C1A5-CEE2-2ABF9FFAB42F1F87&USID=3251&RID=9701135


4/21/22, 3:19 PM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1043702&extid=373036&CFID=93… 2/2

[12/11/2021 14:10] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Spoken to OI. She had viewed TP video. She still feels that TP should not turn into 3rd lane and she was being hit by TP. Explained to her that TP
video shows that TP had ald pass by her car and suddenly there is a jerk which suggested that she hit TP. Furthermore, under LAG, liability is
really not in OI's favour. OI end up will let insurer to handle and OI hope insurer can fight for her on this case.
[11/11/2021 13:44] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
OI called in. Disputed on TP claim as she said that her wksp advise her that vehicle who make U-turn is 100% at fault. Informed her will review
and get back to her.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2738769 05 Nov 2021
23:06:01

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SGZ9359L SKE4315J 11.00

2739379 09 Nov 2021
11:22:41 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SGZ9359L HOW MEI
KWAN xx.xx

2761232 26 Jan 2022
11:50:27

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SGZ9359L SKE4315J 11.00







