Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 3:17 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - RE: SLQ8340J GR LKK REF : CC4/GRB21011287/Ugs3
Dear Sirs,

Video uploaded. Please deny the claim. It can be seen that insured was already about 1/2 inside TPV lane and stationary
for a good 5secs. TPV should have already seen that our insured vehicle is in his lane and ought to give way to our
insured.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
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Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 November 2021 8:20 pm

To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Mekavathanan Sarangapani <mekavathanan@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] - RE: SLQ8340J GR LKK REF : CC4/GRB21011287/Ugs3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Meka,
We will upload the final estimate list once the repair cost finalised.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 6:54 pm

To: JOYCE.CHOO@ETHOZGROUP.COM

Cc: JINGYEU.YEE@ETHOZGROUP.COM

Subject: YOUR REF: GBJ 7454B (OUR REF: CC4/GRB21011287/Ugs3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLQ 8340J & GBJ 7454B ON 20/09/2021 ***

Attachments: Ol VIDEO 1.MP4; Ol VIDEO 2.MP4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Joyce,
We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured video footage and statement for your easy reference.

Sketch Plan

CRACUMSTANCES OF ACCIDENT

ON THE 20009:2021 AT ABOUT 0705 HRS, | WAS DRIVING VEHICLE A (5LOB340J) ALONG JURCNG WEST STREET 61
MERGING INTO MAJOR ROAD VIA YELLOW BOX AT STANDETILL TRAFFIC, | INCHED FORWARD IM FRONT OF VEHICLE B
(GEJTL54E) TO ENTER LANE 1 BUT WHEN THE TRAFFIC LIGHT TURN GREEN AHEAD, VEHICLE B MOVED FORWARD AND
HIT ME ON THE RIGHT REAR PORTION, NOBODY 15 INJURED.

Based on the video footage, it can be seen that our insured was already about 1/2 inside of your client vehicle’s lane
and stationary for a good 5secs. Your client should have already seen that our insured vehicle is in his lane and ought to
give way to our insured.

In view of above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and not able to look into this matter.
Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.



