11/17/21, 10:50 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: FW: Finalisation of SMY 7013G

fcautogarage pte Itd <fcautogarage@gmail.com>
Tue 16/11/2021 6:36 PM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Dear Mr. Lim,
We hereby accept the finalise amount @$7100.00 and 07days.

Best Regards,
Florence Lee

On Tue, Nov 16, 2021 at 6:13 PM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Florence,

Please be informed that there is an error in the repair days.

It should be 7 repairs days instead of 6 days in view of the extra works on the damaged right rear
fender.

Best Regards,
TG Lim | Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwWMGFhNWIXNAAQAHCParTnBkCNvvAsfwGuUj...  1/2
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11/17/21, 10:50 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 November, 2021 10:18 AM
To: fcautogarage@gmail.com

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalisation of SMY 7013G

Without Prejudice

Hi Florence,

Attached is the adjusted estimate of SMY 7013G

MSIG has approved our recommended COR of LS $ 7,100.00 with 6 repair days.

Please confirm your acceptance of our COR offer and send the LOD and all the necessary
documents to our Case Handler Ms Denise Tay ASAP.

Best Regards,
TG Lim | Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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