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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Serene Lim <serene@limyewboo.com>
Sent: Thursday, 18 November 2021 5:49 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SKV4183H & SMQ58R ALONG UPPER THOMSON ROAD ON 01.11.2021
Attachments: Final Repair Bill $2200.pdf; LTA receipt-20211102-115236.pdf; Rental Agreement.pdf; 

AIG Authorise To Act.pdf

Hi Cecilia  
 
We are quantifying the below 
 

Cost of repair   $2200.00 
Loss of Rental ( 4 days x $110.00 per day) 440.00 
GIA search fee  7.45  
TOTAL   $2647.45 

 
We attached herewith Final Bill, Rental Agreement, LTA Receipt & AIG Authorisation To Act. 
 
Thank you & await your reply soonest. 
 
 
Serene LIM 
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co 
Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 I Hp: +65 96852332 
E-mail: serene@limyewboo.com 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 10:10 am 
To: Serene Lim <serene@limyewboo.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SKV4183H & SMQ58R ALONG UPPER THOMSON ROAD ON 01.11.2021 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Serene,  
 
We refer to the above matter.  
 
The liability is clear.  
 
Thanks  
 
 


