11/16/21, 12:04 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Finalisation of SJY 1953T

fcautogarage pte Itd <fcautogarage@gmail.com>
Thu 11/11/2021 1:55 PM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Dear Mr.Lim,
We hereby confirm the finalise amount @$7050.00 and 6 days.
Thank you

On Wed, Nov 10, 2021 at 10:23 AM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Florence,

Attached is the adjusted estimate of SJY 1953T

Recommended COR is LS $ 7,050.00 with 6 repair days, subjected to the approval of the insurance
company.

Please confirm your acceptance of our COR offer and send the LOD and all the necessary
documents to our Case Handler Ms Denise Tay ASAP.

Best Regards,
TG Lim | Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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