Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 December 2021 6:14 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU2096G LKK REF : CC4/AIG21011199/ps3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Kindly provide us the following and arrange for survey.

e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e PIR result (if any)

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 7, 2021 6:07 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU2096G LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011199/ps3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir / Madam,

Please refer to the below Ol's sketch plan and statement.



Sketch Plan
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong via email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, December 7, 2021 4:15 PM

To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU2096G LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011199/ps3

HI,

Pls advise has you manage to obtain the report of SJS47Y?
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, November 2, 2021 3:29 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU2096G LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011199/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal to release Ol GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong via email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via

email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, November 2, 2021 2:11 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU2096G

Dear Madam,

OUR CLIENT - SJU2096G

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 25/10/21 @1.55pm
AlIG

INS

URED : SJS47Y

Attached our client report.

Pls let us have a copy of the statement/sketch plan of SIS47Y if you have it.
ALSO, pls advise who is the claim handler?

Thank you.

Regards

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel :67556142
Fax:67557719



