Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 May 2022 1:47 PM

To: ‘Ler, Bernard-JQ'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 9629004691SG // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21011199/ps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SJS 47Y(Ol) AND SJU 2096G(TP) ON 25/10/2021]

Attachments: AIG-LKKInvoice1 - AC2202639.PDF; Registered Mail _ Receipt.PDF

Hi Bernard,

Attached is a copy of Merimen Fee + AR Registered Mail Fee invoice for your necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 May 2022 2:40 PM

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AIG Ref: 9629004691SG // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21011199/ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 47Y(Ol) AND SJU

2096G(TP) ON 25/10/2021]

Dear Bernard,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that third party repairer did not arrange for survey till date.

In view of this, we will proceed to close file at our end and submit bill for Merimen fee & Ol NR registered mail fee to
your good office soon.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




