11/24/21, 1:25 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 7592G & SMF 3457K ALONG/AT KJE ON 23/11/2021

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Wed 11/24/2021 1:25 PM
To: Pei Juan <peijuan_lee@aakls.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Based on the circumstances of accident and both parties damage profile, we are of the view that
both parties should exercise caution when merging. The case would be resolved at equal liability.
Therefore, we will proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a
NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.
Yours faithfully,

C.C. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pei Juan <peijuan_lee@aakls.com>

Sent: Friday, November 5, 2021 9:48 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 7592G & SMF 3457K ALONG/AT KJE ON 23/11/2021

Hi Jaslin,

FYI.
https://we.tl/t-z6xzfWelbV

Best regards,
Peljuan

AAK

4 Penjuru Close
Singapore 602574

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGY 5MjASNjAXLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA20QBGAAAAAAApXOAAHQAET... 1/2


mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
https://we.tl/t-z6xzfWeIbV

11/24/21, 1:25 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook
Tel: O FFORRF

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 November 2021 7:05 PM

To: PEIJUAN_LEE@AAKLS.COM

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 7592G & SMF 3457K ALONG/AT KJE ON 23/11/2021

Our Ref: CC6/CTI21011173 /Ars3

AAK LOGISTICS SERVICES PTE LTD - BY EMAIL ONLY
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 7592G & SMF 3457K ALONG/AT KJE ON 23/11/2021

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up
with them.

We have received a claim from SMF 3457K against your motor insurance policy.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized
driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

Kindly let us have video footage as stated in your accident report.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third-party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 7 days i.e. by 04/11/2021.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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